
Public Hearing 
Council Chamber 

City of Arnold, Missouri 

April 6, 2017 
7:00 p.m. 

A. NOTE: The Public Hearing is to Address Modifications to the
Following Codes: Building Code, Residential Code, Mechanical Code,
Electrical Code, Plumbing Code, Property Maintenance Code, and the
Fuel Code.

City Council Immediately Following the Public Hearing 

Agenda 

1. Pledge of Allegiance:

2. Opening Prayer: Oasis Church - Pastor Pat Krepps

3. Roll Call

4. Business from the Floor:

5. Consent Agenda

A. Minutes from March 2, 2017.
Minutes from Special Meeting March 9, 2017.

B. Payroll Warrant #1259 in the Amount of $261,078.58
Payroll Warrant #1260 In the Amount of $253,864.55
Payroll Warrant #1261 in the Amount of $264,642.08

C. General Warrant #5686 in the Amount of $795,339.62
General Warrant #5687 in the Amount of $967,930.76

6. Ordinances:

A. Bill No. 2659: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 500, Section 500.020 of

the Code of Ordinance Amending the Building Code, the Residential Code
and the Property Maintenance Code.

B. Bill No. 2660: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 503, Section 503.010 and
Section 503.030 of the Code of Ordinance Amending the Plumbing Code.

C. Bill No. 2661: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 505, Section 505.010 and
Section 505.030 of the Code of Ordinances Amending the Plumbing Code.



D. Bill No. 2662: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 510, and Section 510.010
and Section 510.020 of the Code of Ordinances Amending the Mechanical
Code.

E. Bill No. 2663: An Ordinance Establishing Chapter 512 of the Code of
Ordinances Creating a Fuel Gas Code.

7. Resolutions:

A. Resolution No. 17-09: A Resolution Authorizing the Release of an
Easement.

B. Resolution No. 17-10: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into
A Contract with Spencer Contracting to Provide Construction Services for
Tenbrook Sidewalks (Project SRTS-INF-H32F(105).

C. Resolution No. 17-11: A Resolution Appointing Trisha Mccutchen to the
Historic Preservation Commission.

D. Resolution No. 17-12: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into a
Contract with TraMar Contracting, Inc. to Provide Street Striping Services
for Section of Old Lemay Ferry Road for the City of Arnold, MO.

E. Resolution No. 17-13: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into
An Agreement with Action Landscaping for Code Enforcement Grass
Cutting Services for 2017-2018 Season.

F. Resolution No. 17-14: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into
a Contract with Peters-Eichler Mechanical Inc. to Provide an HVAC
System for the Arnold Recreation Center.

8. Motion

A. 2017-01, Conditional Use Permit for S & J Snow Cone Stand at Tenbrook
Plaza 776 Jeffco Blvd. (Corner of Jeffco and Tenbrook).

B. 2014-37 Extension for C-4 Development Plan, Five Star Auto Body Parcel­
West Outer Road.

C. 2017-02, Conditional Use Permit for a Shaved Ice Stand at 1857 Jeffco Blvd

D. A Motion to Approve the Destruction of the Attached List of Files.

9. Reports from Mayor, Council, and Committees:

10. Administrative Reports

11. Adjournment



Next Regular City Council Meeting April 20, 2017 7:00 p.m. 
Next Work Session April 13, 2017 at 7:00 p.m. 

April 6, 2017 
Z:\CITYDOCS\AGENDA\COUNCI L \2017 Agenda\20170406.doc 



REGULAR MEETING 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BLVD 

Mayor Ron Counts called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. 

The Pledge of Allegiance was recited. 

Sonya Stevenson from Church in Action offered the opening prayer. 

March 2, 2017 

7:00 p.m. 

Mayor Counts requested a moment of silence in honor of councilman EJ Fleischmann's 
grandfather, John Fleischmann, who recently passed away. 

Those present per roll call taken by City Clerk Tammi Casey: Mayor Counts, Owens, 
Cooley, Amato, McArthur ( excused), Plunk, Sullivan, Fulbright, Fleischmann ( excused), 
Richison, Holden, Sweeney, Boone, Blattner, Kroupa (arrived at 7:33 p.m.) and Chief 
Shockey. 

SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS 

MISSOURI AMERICAN WATER 

Tim Ganz and Mark Radecky from Missouri American Water updated council on the 
work that is being done in the city regarding updates to the sewer lines. Work has begun 
upsizing the sewer pipes on Keywest and they will be moving north from there. The goal 
is to alleviate backups and overflow issues in that area. They are replacing 12" pipe with 
15" pipe, which will significantly increase the flow rate. American Water has also 
completed approximately 2 miles of pipe lining in the Bayshore and Maxville areas. 
Mayor Counts reminded everyone that one of the conditions of sale for the sewer system 
was that American Water invests $5 million in improvements over the next few years. 

HOCHSCHILD, BLOOM & COMP ANY LLP 

Tammy Alsop from Hochschild, Bloom and Company spoke to council concerning the 
2016 fiscal year-end audit results. Ms. Alsop reminded council that the city has received 
the GFOA award for 27 years. Once again the city has received an unmodified opinion 
on the audit, which is the highest opinion a city can receive. Bryan Richison stated that 
last year the city had a very good fiscal year. Revenue came in higher than budgeted and 
all departments did an excellent job maintaining and managing their budget. The Rec 
Center also had an excellent year. Mr. Richison reminded council that when he started in 
2013 the total city debt was $79 million. That debt is now down to $44 million. Mayor 
Counts thanked Mr. Richison and staff for all their hard work. Mr. Amato stated that the 
Rec Center should be considered a "quality oflife" facility, not necessarily a big source 
of revenue. The fact that the Rec Center did well last year shows that Susie Boone and 
her staff have done an excellent job. 



2 

Regular Meeting 
March 2, 2017 

BUSINESS FROM THE FLOOR 

Sara Riley - 3109 Rosedale - Thanked council for the street repair work that is being 
done. Ms. Riley informed council that the Rosedale Subdivision has submitted their 
Cooley-Fulbright City Beautification Grant application. Ms. Riley is a new trustee for 
Rosedale Subdivision and she stated that she looks forward to working with the city. 

Ray Schmidt - 2110 Cromwell Court - Informed council that the Defense Mapping 
Agency on Vogel has installed generators on their roof and the sound emitted from them 
reaches 70 decibels or higher. He would like to have some sort of noise reduction 
procedure put in place. Bryan Richison stated that he will contact Defense Mapping, but 
they are a federal agency and we may not have much jurisdiction over them. 

CONSENT AGENDA 

A. MINUTES FROM THE FEBRUARY 16, 2017 MEETING
B. PAYROLL WARRANT N0. 1258 IN THE AMOUNT OF $254,649.68

C. GENERAL WARRANT NO. 5685 IN THE AMOUNT OF $329,507.65

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve the consent agenda. 
Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; 
McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused); 
6 Yeas: Consent agenda approved. 

ORDINANCES 

BILL NO. 2657 - AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 100, ARTICLE II, 
SECTION 100.140 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES AMENDING THE 
GENERAL PENAL TY was read twice by City Clerk Tammi Casey. Roll call vote: 
Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur ( excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; 
Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann ( excused); 6 Yeas: Ordinance passed. 



3 

Regular Meeting 
March 2, 2017 

BILL NO. 2658 -AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AND ENACTING A NEW CODE 
OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF ARNOLD, COUNTY OF JEFFERSON, 
STATE OF MO; ESTABLISHING THE SAME; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL 

OF CERTAIN ORDINANCES NOT INCLUDED THEREIN, EXCEPT AS 

HEREIN EXPRESSLY PROVIDED; PROVIDING FOR THE MANNER OF 

AMENDING SUCH CODE OF ORDINANCES; PROVIDING PENALTY FOR 
THE VIOLATION THEREOF; PROVIDING WHEN THIS ORDINANCE SHALL 
BECOME EFFECTIVE was read twice by City Clerk Tammi Casey. Roll call vote: 
Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur ( excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; 

Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann ( excused); 6 Yeas: Ordinance passed. 

RESOLUTIONS 

RESOLUTION NO. 17-06-A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE 
OF A PORTABLE SALT CONVEYOR FOR THE CITY OF ARNOLD 

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-06. 
Seconded by Phil Amato. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; 
McArthur ( excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann ( excused); 6 
Yeas: Resolution approved. 

RESOLUTION NO. 17-07 -A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE 

OF MOSQUITO CHEMICALS FOR THE CITY OF ARNOLD 

Jason Fulbright made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-07. 
Seconded by Vern Sullivan. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; 
McArthur ( excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann ( excused); 6 

Yeas: Resolution approved. 

MOTIONS 

A. A MOTION TO APPROVE THE FIREWORKS DISPLAY FOR THE

ANNUAL BLOCK PARTY TO BE HELD ON MAY 12, 2017 AT THE ST.

JOHN'S LUTHERAN CHURCH, 3517 JEFFCO BLVD.

Phil Amato made a motion and so moved to approve the fireworks display for St. 
John's Lutheran Church. Seconded by David Owens. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; 
Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur ( excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; 

Fleischmann ( excused); 6 Yeas: Motion carried. 



Regular Meeting 
March 2, 2017 

B. A MOTION TO HOLD A CLOSED SESSION IMMEDIATELY

FOLLOWING THE CITY COUNCIL MEETING FOR THE PURPOSE OF

DISCUSSING REAL ESTATE PURSUANT TO RSMo SECTION

610.002(2)

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve holding a closed session after 
the council meeting. Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, 
yes; Amato, yes; McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; 
Fleischmann ( excused); 6 Yeas: Motion carried.

REPORTS FROM MAYOR, COUNCIL AND COMMITTEES 

Mayor Counts - Encouraged everyone to attend the Rotary Pancake Breakfast being 
held this Saturday at First Baptist Church of Arnold from 7:00 a.m. to 12:00 p.m. 

Vern Sullivan - Ward 3 - Stated that work has begun at Arnold Tenbrook and Jeffco 
and it is going well. 

Phil Amato - Ward 3 - Stated the Veterans Park project has been discussed for the past 
few years. He would like the city to work with the committee regarding the land that was 
sold to them to get the project moving forward. 

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS 

Bryan Richison - Informed council that he initially interviewed 16 candidates for the 
Parks and Recreation Director position. He brought back 5 for a second interview with a 
panel consisting of himself, Mayor Counts, Gary Plunk and Dan Kroupa. 

Mayor Counts announced a ten minute recess before going into Closed Session . 

••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

Closed Session ended at 8:37 p.m. 

A motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Butch Cooley. Seconded by Vern Sullivan. 
Voice vote: All yeas. 

Meeti, adjourned at 8:3� .f.m.

t 
// 

C'\, w�,. !<�,,, 
Cityierk Tammi Casey, MRCi 



MEETING: 

DATE: 

PAGE: 

REGULAR 

3/2/2017 

1 

COUNCIL MEMBERS: 

MAYOR RON COUNTS 

COUNCJL: DAVID OWENS 

COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY 

COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO 

COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR 

COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK 

COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN 

COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT 

COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN ' 

CITY 

ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON 

CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY 

COM DEV MARY HOLDEN 

CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY 

CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI 

ROLL CALL 

BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION 

,.._ CX) z
...J 

I-� 
L() L() Oco ...J co 

Zo N N -o I- ' 
(.) Wz 0 0 ::> ,.._ 

(/) w ...J ... z c., z z o ·
0 0� ...J ...J Cf) 0 

(.) ...J ...J wZ 
co CD 0:: 

PRESENT 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES YES YES 

EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED 

PRESENT PARKS DIR: SUSIE BOONE 

PRESENT PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER 

PRESENT TREASURER: DAN KROUPA 

PRESENT POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY 

z 

Or--
-o I- ' 
::> ,.._ 
...J ... 

o ·(/) 0 
wZ 
0:: 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 



MEETING: 

DATE: 

PAGE: 

REGULAR 

3/2/2017 

2 

COUNCIL MEMBERS: 

MAYOR RON COUNTS 

COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS 

COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY 

COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO 

COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR 

COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK 

COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN 

COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT 

COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN 

CITY 

ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON 

CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY 

COM DEV MARY HOLDEN 

CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY 

CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI 

ROLL CALL 

BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION 

� 

0 <( (l) Zg 
t-��z<C..J

/'.: Z 0:: IO:: ID 
Q So o� Io:: 
f-..J:l;:'1-0c: O<(wt-:::,0:: 
:E 0:: (/) ...J::, - I u. 0 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

0 

��z 
zOO 
o ..Ju; _o

(/) 
I- 0 W 0 ..J (/) 
:f:O 

I 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

YES 

YES 

YES 

EXCUSED 

PARKS DIR: SUSIE BOONE 

PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER 

TREASURER: DAN KROUPA 

POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY 



SPECIAL MEETING 
COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BL VD 

Mayor Ron Counts called the special meeting to order at 7 :26 p.m. 

March 9, 2017 
7:26 p.m. 

Those present per roll call taken by City Clerk Tammi Casey: Mayor Ron Counts, 
Fleischmann, McArthur, Cooley, Owens (excused) Amato, Fulbright, Sullivan, Plunk, 
Richison, Holden ( excused), Sweeney, Blattner, Kroupa and Chief Shockey. 

RESOLUTIONS 

RESOLUTION NO. 17-08 -A RESOLUTION APPROVING A COOLEY­
FULBRIGHT BEAUTIFICATION PROGRAM GRANT FOR THE ROSEDALE 
SUBDIVISION 

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-08. 
Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Fleischmann, yes; McArthur, yes; Cooley, 
yes; Owens ( excused); Amato, yes; Fulbright, yes; Sullivan, yes; Plunk, yes; 7 Yeas: 

Resolution passed. 

MOTION 

A. A MOTION TO HOLD A CLOSED SESSION IMMEDIATELY
FOLLOWING THE SPECIAL MEETING FOR THE PURPOSE OF
DISCUSSING PERSONNEL PURSUANT TO RSMo SECTION 610-21 (3)

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to hold a closed session immediately 
following the special meeting. Seconded by Gary Plunk. Roll call vote: Fleischmann, 
yes; McArthur, yes; Cooley, yes; Owens (excused); Amato, yes; Fulbright, yes; Sullivan, 

yes; Plunk, yes; 7 Yeas: Motion carried . 

••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••••• 

Closed session ended at 7:47 p.m. 

A motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Vern Sullivan. Seconded by Butch 
Cooley. 

Meeting adjourned at 7:47 p.m. 



MEETING: 

DATE: 

PAGE: 

SPECIAL MEETING 

3/9/2017 

1 

COUNCIL MEMBERS: 

MAYOR RON COUNTS 

COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN 

COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR 

COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY 

COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS 

COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO 

COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT 

COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN 

COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK 

CITY 

ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON 

CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY 

COM DEV MARY HOLDEN 

CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY 

CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI 

ROLL CALL 

BILL NO • RESOLUTION • MOTION 

z 
0 

Oco 8�z -o
200.... ' 

(.) ::,r--
o

-'
ui _, _, .... _(.) (/) _, o · I- 0 w 

0 CJ') 0 
0 _, (/) 

0:: wZ �o 0:: 
I 

PRESENT 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES 

EXCUSED EXCUSED EXCUSED 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT YES YES 

PRESENT PARKS DIR: 

PRESENT PU�LIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER 

EXCUSED TREASURER: DAN KROUPA 

PRESENT POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY 

-

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 



WORK SESSION 

COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BL VD. 

March 9, 2017 

7:00 PM 

Mayor Ron Counts called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. Those in attendance as noted by City Clerk 

Tammi Casey; Mayor Counts, Fleischmann, McArthur, Cooley, Owens (excused), Amato, Fulbright, 

Sullivan, Plunk, Richison, Holden (excused), Sweeney, Blattner, Kroupa (arrived 7:03 p.m), Chief Shockey. 

SOLAR ECLIPSE 

Don Ficken from the St. Louis Astronomical Society spoke regarding the upcoming total eclipse which 

will take place on Monday, August 21, 2017. The last time there was a total solar eclipse in St. Louis was 

in 1442 and it will not happen in St. Louis again until the year 2505. The moon will be traveling at 1500 

miles per hour in which the path of totality will be 70 miles wide and will last for two minutes. Mr. 

Ficken informed council that there will be a Solar Eclipse Expo on June 17, 2017 at the Greensfelder 

Recreation Complex in Queeny Park. It will include exhibits, presentations by eclipse experts and 

children's activities. This event is set up to prepare everyone for this historic event. 

Teresa Kohut and Peggy Allen from Arnold's Parks and Recreation Department presented their 

departments' ideas to council regarding the event. They are suggesting a festival to be held on August 

19th through August 21st _ It would include items such as an "eclipse of the sun run", children's crafts, 

movies, music and inflatables, just to name a few. They would also have eclipse T-shirts and glasses for 

sale. 

Bryan Richison explained to council that the city has also taken into consideration the possibility of an 

increase in traffic congestion and emergency response calls. 

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to adjourn the meeting. Seconded by EJ Fleischmann. 

Voice vote: All yeas. 

Meeting adjourned at 7:23 p.m. 



MEETING: 

DATE: 

PAGE: 

WORK SESSION 

3/9/2017 

1 

COUNCIL MEMBERS: 

MAYOR RON COUNTS 

COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN 

COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR 

COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY 

COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS 

COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO 

COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT 

COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN 

COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK 

CITY 

ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON 

CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY 

COM DEV MARY HOLDEN 

CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY 

CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI 

ROLL CALL 

BILL NO - RESOLUTION • MOTION 

z 

z 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

EXCUSED 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT 

PRESENT PARKS DIR: 

PRESENT PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER 

EXCUSED TREASURER: DAN KROUPA 

PRESENT POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY 

-

PRESENT 

ARRIVED 

7:03 

PRESENT 



6.A, B, C,

DAND-E

CITY OF AR NOLD, CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING 

TO: 

FROM: 

SUBJECT: 

DATE: 

CC: 

THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL 

MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR 

ADOPTION OF THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING, RESIDENTIAL, 
PROPERTY MAINTANENCE, PLUMBING, MECHANICAL, FUEL AND GAS, 
AND 2014 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE 

MARCH 31, 2017 

Staff is pleased to present five ordinances for the Council consideration and adoption of the 2015 
International Building, Residential, Property Maintenance, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fuel and Gas and the 
2014 National Electrical Code. 

The ninety (90) day review period was advertised at the end of December 2016. Our Building 
Commissioner along with Staff has worked on the review and drafting of the amendments that take 
into consideration quite a few of the Home Builders Association suggested changes to the codes. 

Please note, the 2015 Fuel and Gas code is a new addition and Staff recommends it's adoption. 



BILL NO. 2659 ORDINANCE NO. 
-----

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 500, SECTION 500.020 OF 
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES AMENDING THE BUILDING CODE, 
THE RESIDENTIAL CODE AND THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE 
CODE. 

WHEREAS, the international building code, international residential code and the 
property maintenance code have been updated in 2015; and 

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of these 

updates; and 

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided; 

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF 
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. Chapter 500, Section 500.020 is hereby repealed and replaced with the 

following: 

"A. International Building Code. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file 
in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Arnold, Missouri, being marked and 

designated as "The International Building Code, 2016 Edition" and appendices E, G, H 
and I as published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted as the Building 
Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri regulating and governing the conditions and 

maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for 
supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure 
that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of 
buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such 
structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees 
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms 
of said Building Code on file in the office of the City of Arnold are hereby referred to, 

adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise 
modified by this Chapter. 

1. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code requiring the issuance
of certificates of use and occupancy, such certificates shall be termed certificates of

compliance.

2. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code to the contrary,
procedures for giving notice of unsafe conditions and correction orders shall be as
provided in the International Property Maintenance Code 2015, except in the case of
declaration of nuisance. Procedures for giving notice of declaration of nuisance shall be
as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code.

1 



3. Notwithstanding provisions in the International Building Code to the contrary, the right
to appeal orders to correct unsafe conditions shall be as provided in the International
Property Maintenance Code 2015, except as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code in the
case of dangerous buildings.

4. Amendments to the International Building Code 2015.

a. Section BI05.5 and Bl05.6 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"Section 105.5 Expiration, extension, revocation of permits shall be administered in 
accordance with Section 500.060, Article I, Chapter 500, Arnold Code of Ordinances. 11 

b. Section BI08.6 Refunds is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"Section 109.6 -Refunds: Shall be administered in accordance with the adopted 
building department fee schedule." 

c. Section Bl 13.4 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
11114.4 - Violations Penalties: Shall be governed as prescribed in Section 500.070, 
Article I, Chapter 500, Arnold Code of Ordinances. 11 

d. Section Bl 15 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
11116 -Unsafe Structures and Equipment: Shall be defined and administered in 
accordance with Chapter 515, Arnold Code of Ordinances." 

e. Section Bl 12.3 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
11113.3 -The Board of Appeals: Shall consist of members appointed by the Mayor in 
accordance with Section 500.120, Article I, Chapter 500, of the Arnold Code of 
Ordinances." 

f. Section B201.4 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"201.4 Terms not defined: Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized 
by this Section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context 
implies or failing that as ascribed in the Webster's Tenth New Collegiate Dictionary, as 
revised." 

g. Section B3412.2 Applicability is hereby amended by inserting the date of (October
2, 1972) as the effective date of Building Codes within the City of Arnold, Missouri. 

B. International Residential Code. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file
in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Arnold, Missouri, being marked and
designated as "The International Residential Code, 2015 Edition" and appendices A,
B, C, D, E, G, H, I, J, K, No, 0, P, Q, and U as published by the International Code
Council is hereby adopted as the Residential Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri
regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal and demolition of detached one­
and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (town houses) not
more than three (3) stories in height with separate means of egress as herein
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and
each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
Residential Code on file in the office of the City of Arnold are hereby referred to,
adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise
modified by this Chapter.

2 



1. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Residential Code requiring the
issuance of certificates of use and occupancy, such certificates shall be termed certificates
of compliance.

2. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Residential Code to the contrary,
procedures for giving notice of unsafe conditions and correction orders shall be as

provided in the International Property Maintenance Code 2015, except in the case of
declaration of nuisance. Procedures for giving notice of declaration of nuisance shall be

as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code.

3. Notwithstanding provisions in the International Residential Code to the contrary, the
right to appeal orders to correct unsafe conditions shall be as provided in the International
Property Maintenance Code 2015, except as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code in the
case of dangerous buildings.

4. Amendments to the International Residential Code 2015:
a. Section IO 1.1 Title is amended by inserting "The City of Arnold".
b. Section I 02.5 Appendices is amended by the addition of Section 102.5.1

Appendices adopted as follows: 
"Section 102.5.1 Appendices Adopted. Appendix His hereby adopted as part of this 
code." 

c. Section 105.5 and 105.6 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"105.5 Expiration, extension, revocation of permits shall be administered in accordance 
with Section 500.060, Article I, Chapter 500, Arnold Code of Ordinances." 

d. Section 113. I and R 11.3 3 is deleted without replacement.
e. Section I 13.3 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

"112.3 The Board of Appeals shall consist of members appointed by the Mayor in 
accordance with Section 500.120, Article I, Chapter 500, of the Arnold Code of 

Ordinances." 
f. Table 301.2 (I) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria is completed by the

establishment and insertion of the following design criteria: 

Ground snow load 20 PSF 

Wind speed 90 MPH 

Seismic design category D,O 

Weathering Severe 

Frost line depth 30 inches 

Termite 

Winter design temp 

Ice shield 

Moderate to heavy 

6 degrees F 

yes 

Flood hazards 

Air freezing index 

Mean annual temp. 

Date of current FIRM panels (April 05, 2006) 

0-1,000

54 degrees F

g. 302.13 Fire Protection Floors: Amend as follows:
Section 3 .1 :The aggregate area of the unprotected floor assembly does not exceed 100 
square feet per HVAC zone. Section 3.2:Areas of the floor assembly covered by HVAC 

3 



metal plenum, trunk lines, and steel structural beams shall be considered protected. 
Gypsum wallboard membrane shall be installed as close as possible to the above listed 
items. 

h. Section 306 is amended to add the following:
306.5 Floor Drain. All basements shall have a floor drain within ten (IO) feet of the 
heating/cooling system(s) and water heater. The floor drain shall comply with Chapter 

27. 

i. 311. 7. 5 Landings for stairways shall be amended as follows: There shall be a
floor or landing at the top or bottom of each stairway. A top landing is not required 
where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the exterior side of the door, 
provided that door does not swing over the stairway. 
Exception: A floor or landing is not required at the top of an interior or exterior flight of 
stairs, including stairs in an enclosed garage, provided a door does not swing over the 
stairs. A flight of stairs shall not have a vertical rise larger than twelve (12) feet (3,685 
mm) between floor levels or landings. The width of each landing shall not be less than
the width of the stairway served. Every landing shall have a minimum dimension of
thirty- six (36) inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of travel. For remodeling
projects in existing homes, stair tread and riser will be allowed to mimic previous or
existing conditions.

1 story 
2 story 

3 story 

1 story 
2 story 

3 story 

1 storv 

2 storv 

3 story 

j. Section 403.1(4) Light frame construction table is added .

Table 403.1(4) 
Minimum Width of Concrete, Precast, or Masonry Footings (inches) 
i L' ht F C t f 'th P F b ' t d R f T a b cor U! - rame ons rue 10n w1 re- a nca e 00 russes , 

Load-Bearing Value of Soil (Qsf} 

1500 2000 3000 >4000

Conventional light-frame construction with !!re-fabricated trusses 

12 12 12 12 
15 12 12 12 
23 17 12 12 

4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry

12 12 12 12 
21 16 12 12 
32 24 16 12 

8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry

16 12 12 12 
29 21 14 12 
42 32 21 16 

For SI: 1 inch= 25.4 mm, 1 pound per square foot= 0.0479 kPa 
a. Spread footings shall be same thickness as the wall (minimum of 8 inches).

4 


















































































































































































































