City of Arnold, Missouri

Public Hearing April 6, 2017
Council Chamber 7:00 p.m.

A. NOTE: The Public Hearing is to Address Modifications to the
Following Codes: Building Code, Residential Code, Mechanical Code,
Electrical Code, Plumbing Code, Property Maintenance Code, and the
Fuel Code.

City Council Immediately Following the Public Hearing

Agenda

-

. Pledge of Allegiance:
2. Opening Prayer: Oasis Church — Pastor Pat Krepps
3. Roll Call

4. Business from the Floor:

(&)}

. Consent Agenda

A. Minutes from March 2, 2017.

Minutes from Special Meeting March 9, 2017.

B. Payroll Warrant #1259 in the Amount of $261,078.58
Payroll Warrant #1260 In the Amount of $253,864.55
Payroll Warrant #1261 in the Amount of $264,642.08

C. General Warrant #5686 in the Amount of $795,339.62
General Warrant #5687 in the Amount of $967,930.76

6. Ordinances:

A. Bill No. 2659: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 500, Section 500.020 of
the Code of Ordinance Amending the Building Code, the Residential Code
and the Property Maintenance Code.

B. Bill No. 2660: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 503, Section 503.010 and
Section 503.030 of the Code of Ordinance Amending the Plumbing Code.

C. Bill No. 2661: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 505, Section 505.010 and
Section 505.030 of the Code of Ordinances Amending the Plumbing Code.



D. Bill No. 2662: An Ordinance Amending Chapter 510, and Section 510.010
and Section 510.020 of the Code of Ordinances Amending the Mechanical
Code.

E. Bill No. 2663: An Ordinance Establishing Chapter 512 of the Code of
Ordinances Creating a Fuel Gas Code.

7. Resolutions:

A. Resolution No. 17-09: A Resolution Authorizing the Release of an
Easement.

B. Resolution No. 17-10: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into
A Contract with Spencer Contracting to Provide Construction Services for
Tenbrook Sidewalks (Project SRTS-INF-H32F(105).

C. Resolution No. 17-11: A Resolution Appointing Trisha McCutchen to the
Historic Preservation Commission.

D. Resolution No. 17-12: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into a
Contract with TraMar Contracting, Inc. to Provide Street Striping Services
for Section of Old Lemay Ferry Road for the City of Arnold, MO.

E. Resolution No. 17-13: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into
An Agreement with Action Landscaping for Code Enforcement Grass
Cutting Services for 2017-2018 Season.

F. Resolution No. 17-14: A Resolution Authorizing the Mayor to Enter into

a Contract with Peters-Eichler Mechanical Inc. to Provide an HVAC
System for the Arnold Recreation Center.

8. Motion

A. 2017-01, Conditional Use Permit for S & J Snow Cone Stand at Tenbrook
Plaza 776 Jeffco Blvd. (Corner of Jeffco and Tenbrook).

B. 2014-37 Extension for C-4 Development Plan, Five Star Auto Body Parcel-
West Outer Road.

C. 2017-02, Conditional Use Permit for a Shaved Ice Stand at 1857 Jeffco Blvd
D. A Motion to Approve the Destruction of the Attached List of Files.
9. Reports from Mayor, Council, and Committees:
10. Administrative Reports

11. Adjournment



Next Regular City Council Meeting April 20, 2017 7:00 p.m.
Next Work Session April 13, 2017 at 7:00 p.m.

April 6, 2017
Z:\CITYDOCS\AGENDA\COUNCIL\2017 Agenda\20170406.doc



REGULAR MEETING ' March 2, 2017
COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BLVD 7:00 p.m.

Mayor Ron Counts called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.
The Pledge of Allegiance was recited.
Sonya Stevenson from Church in Action offered the opening prayer.

Mayor Counts requested a moment of silence in honor of councilman EJ Fleischmann’s
grandfather, John Fleischmann, who recently passed away.

Those present per roll call taken by City Clerk Tammi Casey: Mayor Counts, Owens,
Cooley, Amato, McArthur (excused), Plunk, Sullivan, Fulbright, Fleischmann (excused),
Richison, Holden, Sweeney, Boone, Blattner, Kroupa (arrived at 7:33 p.m.) and Chief
Shockey.

SPECIAL PRESENTATIONS
MISSOURI AMERICAN WATER

Tim Ganz and Mark Radecky from Missouri American Water updated council on the
work that is being done in the city regarding updates to the sewer lines. Work has begun
upsizing the sewer pipes on Keywest and they will be moving north from there. The goal
is to alleviate backups and overflow issues in that area. They are replacing 12” pipe with
15” pipe, which will significantly increase the flow rate. American Water has also
completed approximately 2 miles of pipe lining in the Bayshore and Maxville areas.
Mayor Counts reminded everyone that one of the conditions of sale for the sewer system
was that American Water invests $5 million in improvements over the next few years.

HOCHSCHILD, BLOOM & COMPANY LLP

Tammy Alsop from Hochschild, Bloom and Company spoke to council concerning the
2016 fiscal year-end audit results. Ms. Alsop reminded council that the city has received
the GFOA award for 27 years. Once again the city has received an unmodified opinion
on the audit, which is the highest opinion a city can receive. Bryan Richison stated that
last year the city had a very good fiscal year. Revenue came in higher than budgeted and
all departments did an excellent job maintaining and managing their budget. The Rec
Center also had an excellent year. Mr. Richison reminded council that when he started in
2013 the total city debt was $79 million. That debt is now down to $44 million. Mayor
Counts thanked Mr. Richison and staff for all their hard work. Mr. Amato stated that the
Rec Center should be considered a “quality of life” facility, not necessarily a big source
of revenue. The fact that the Rec Center did well last year shows that Susie Boone and
her staff have done an excellent job.



2
Regular Meeting
March 2, 2017

BUSINESS FROM THE FLOOR

Sara Riley — 3109 Rosedale — Thanked council for the street repair work that is being
done. Ms. Riley informed council that the Rosedale Subdivision has submitted their
Cooley-Fulbright City Beautification Grant application. Ms. Riley is a new trustee for
Rosedale Subdivision and she stated that she looks forward to working with the city.

Ray Schmidt — 2110 Cromwell Court — Informed council that the Defense Mapping
Agency on Vogel has installed generators on their roof and the sound emitted from them
reaches 70 decibels or higher. He would like to have some sort of noise reduction
procedure put in place. Bryan Richison stated that he will contact Defense Mapping, but
they are a federal agency and we may not have much jurisdiction over them.

CONSENT AGENDA

A. MINUTES FROM THE FEBRUARY 16, 2017 MEETING
B. PAYROLL WARRANT NO. 1258 IN THE AMOUNT OF $254,649.68
C. GENERAL WARRANT NO. 5685 IN THE AMOUNT OF $329,507.65

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve the consent agenda.
Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes;
McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused);
6 Yeas: Consent agenda approved.

ORDINANCES

BILL NO. 2657 — AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 100, ARTICLE 11,
SECTION 100.140 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES AMENDING THE
GENERAL PENALTY was read twice by City Clerk Tammi Casey. Roll call vote:
Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes;
Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused); 6 Yeas: Ordinance passed.



3
Regular Meeting
March 2,2017

BILL NO. 2658 — AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AND ENACTING A NEW CODE
OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF ARNOLD, COUNTY OF JEFFERSON,
STATE OF MO; ESTABLISHING THE SAME; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL
OF CERTAIN ORDINANCES NOT INCLUDED THEREIN, EXCEPT AS
HEREIN EXPRESSLY PROVIDED; PROVIDING FOR THE MANNER OF
AMENDING SUCH CODE OF ORDINANCES; PROVIDING PENALTY FOR
THE VIOLATION THEREOF; PROVIDING WHEN THIS ORDINANCE SHALL
BECOME EFFECTIVE was read twice by City Clerk Tammi Casey. Roll call vote:
Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes;
Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused); 6 Yeas: Ordinance passed.

RESOLUTIONS

RESOLUTION NO. 17-06 - A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE
OF A PORTABLE SALT CONVEYOR FOR THE CITY OF ARNOLD

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-06.
Seconded by Phil Amato. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes;
McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused); 6
Yeas: Resolution approved.

RESOLUTION NO. 17-07 — A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE PURCHASE
OF MOSQUITO CHEMICALS FOR THE CITY OF ARNOLD

Jason Fulbright made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-07.
Seconded by Vern Sullivan. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley, yes; Amato, yes;
McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes; Fleischmann (excused); 6
Yeas: Resolution approved.

MOTIONS

~A. AMOTION TO APPROVE THE FIREWORKS DISPLAY FOR THE
ANNUAL BLOCK PARTY TO BE HELD ON MAY 12,2017 AT THE ST.
JOHN’S LUTHERAN CHURCH, 3517 JEFFCO BLVD.

Phil Amato made a motion and so moved to approve the fireworks display for St.
John’s Lutheran Church. Seconded by David Owens. Roll call vote: Owens, yes;
Cooley, yes; Amato, yes; McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes;
Fleischmann (excused); 6 Yeas: Motion carried.



4
Regular Meeting
March 2, 2017

B. A MOTION TO HOLD A CLOSED SESSION IMMEDIATELY
FOLLOWING THE CITY COUNCIL MEETING FOR THE PURPOSE OF
DISCUSSING REAL ESTATE PURSUANT TO RSMo SECTION
610.002(2)

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve holding a closed session after
the council meeting. Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Owens, yes; Cooley,
yes; Amato, yes; McArthur (excused), Plunk, yes; Sullivan, yes; Fulbright, yes;
Fleischmann (excused); 6 Yeas: Motion carried.

REPORTS FROM MAYOR, COUNCIL AND COMMITTEES

Mayor Counts — Encouraged everyone to attend the Rotary Pancake Breakfast being
held this Saturday at First Baptist Church of Amold from 7:00 a.m. to 12:00 p.m.

Vern Sullivan — Ward 3 — Stated that work has begun at Armold Tenbrook and Jeffco
and it is going well.

Phil Amato — Ward 3 — Stated the Veterans Park project has been discussed for the past
few years. He would like the city to work with the committee regarding the land that was
sold to them to get the project moving forward.

ADMINISTRATIVE REPORTS

Bryan Richison — Informed council that he initially interviewed 16 candidates for the
Parks and Recreation Director position. He brought back 5 for a second interview with a
panel consisting of himself, Mayor Counts, Gary Plunk and Dan Kroupa.

Mayor Counts announced a ten minute recess before going into Closed Session.

Closed Session ended at 8:37 p.m.

A motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Butch Cooley. Seconded by Vern Sullivan.
Voice vote: All yeas.

Meeting adjourned at 8:37 p.m.

i/ 5 A oimd 7

City Clerk Tammi Casey, MRCC'/




CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI

ROLL CALL
MEETING: REGULAR
DATE: 3/2/2017 BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION
PAGE: 1
~ [oo] zZ 2

3 E« 8 Q@ Cw [ORN

< Za & QY E< EQ

O u= g ; o~ o~

- zu 2 z

x ©'% = = wZ w2z

om m o o

COUNCIL MEMBERS:
MAYOR RON COUNTS PRESENT
COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS PRESENT YES YES YES YES YES
COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY PRESENT YES YES YES YES YES
COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO PRESENT YES YES YES YES. YES
COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED [ EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED
COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK PRESENT YES YES YES YES YES
COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN PRESENT YES YES YES YES YES
COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT PRESENT YES YES YES YES YES
COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED
CITY
ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON PRESENT |PARKS DIR: SUSIE BOONE PRESENT
CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY PRESENT |PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER PRESENT
COM DEV MARY HOLDEN PRESENT |TREASURER: DAN KROUPA PRESENT
CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY PRESENT [POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY PRESENT




CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI

ROLL CALL
MEETING: REGULAR
DATE: 3/2/2017 BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION
PAGE: 2
f— !
< ) a
P_g®Z9 2z
zzZenp| 2 Qo
695c4¥zx| So9
B2 ERE| Eqil
= gv32 | 5g°
o 5 T
COUNCIL MEMBERS:
MAYOR RON COUNTS
COUNCIL: 'DAVID OWENS YES YES
COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY YES YES
COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO YES YES
COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR EXCUSED | EXCUSED
COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK YES YES
COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN YES YES
COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT YES YES
‘COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN EXCUSED | EXCUSED
cITY
ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON PARKS DIR: SUSIE BOONE
CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY |PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER
COM DEV MARY HOLDEN TREASURER: DAN KROUPA
CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY




SPECIAL MEETING March 9, 2017
COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BLVD 7:26 p.m.

Mayor Ron Counts called the special meeting to order at 7:26 p.m.

Those present per roll call taken by City Clerk Tammi Casey: Mayor Ron Counts,
Fleischmann, McArthur, Cooley, Owens (excused) Amato, Fulbright, Sullivan, Plunk,
Richison, Holden (excused), Sweeney, Blattner, Kroupa and Chief Shockey.

RESOLUTIONS

RESOLUTION NO. 17-08 - A RESOLUTION APPROVING A COOLEY-
FULBRIGHT BEAUTIFICATION PROGRAM GRANT FOR THE ROSEDALE
SUBDIVISION

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to approve Resolution No. 17-08.
Seconded by Jason Fulbright. Roll call vote: Fleischmann, yes; McArthur, yes; Cooley,
yes; Owens (excused); Amato, yes; Fulbright, yes; Sullivan, yes; Plunk, yes; 7 Yeas:
Resolution passed.

MOTION

A. AMOTION TO HOLD A CLOSED SESSION IMMEDIATELY
FOLLOWING THE SPECIAL MEETING FOR THE PURPOSE OF
DISCUSSING PERSONNEL PURSUANT TO RSMo SECTION 610-21 (3)

Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to hold a closed session immediately
following the special meeting. Seconded by Gary Plunk. Roll call vote: Fleischmann,
yes; McArthur, yes; Cooley, yes; Owens (excused); Amato, yes; Fulbright, yes; Sullivan,
yes; Plunk, yes; 7 Yeas: Motion carried.

Closed session ended at 7:47 p.m.

A motion to adjourn the meeting was made by Vern Sullivan. Seconded by Butch
Cooley.

Meeting adjourned at 7:47 p.m.

\@MM% éfi@f

Clty Clerk Tammi Casey, MRCC




CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI

ROLL CALL
MEETING: SPECIAL MEETING
DATE: 3/9/2017 BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION
PAGE: 1
o)
4 Z ouw
(@)
3 ES - 88
(&} o~ =5
- 55 | 2S48
]
B | 42 | 2g°
o =
COUNCIL MEMBERS:
MAYOR RON COUNTS PRESENT
COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: _BUTCH COOLEY PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS EXCUSED | EXCUSED | EXCUSED
COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: ERN SULLIVAN PRESENT YES YES
COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK PRESENT YES YES
CITY
ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON PRESENT |PARKS DIR: -
CITY CLERK TAMMI| CASEY PRESENT [PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER PRESENT
COM DEV MARY HOLDEN EXCUSED |TREASURER: DAN KROUPA PRESENT
CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY PRESENT (POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY PRESENT




WORK SESSION March 9, 2017
COUNCIL CHAMBERS 2101 JEFFCO BLVD. 7:00 PM

Mayor Ron Counts called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m. Those in attendance as noted by City Clerk
Tammi Casey; Mayor Counts, Fleischmann, McArthur, Cooley, Owens (excused), Amato, Fulbright,
Sullivan, Plunk, Richison, Holden (excused), Sweeney, Blattner, Kroupa (arrived 7:03 p.m), Chief Shockey.

SOLAR ECLIPSE

Don Ficken from the St. Louis Astronomical Society spoke regarding the upcoming total eclipse which
will take place on Monday, August 21, 2017. The last time there was a total solar eclipse in St. Louis was
in 1442 and it will not happen in St. Louis again until the year 2505. The moon will be traveling at 1500
miles per hour in which the path of totality will be 70 miles wide and will last for two minutes. Mr.
Ficken informed council that there will be a Solar Eclipse Expo on June 17, 2017 at the Greensfelder
Recreation Complex in Queeny Park. It will include exhibits, presentations by eclipse experts and
children’s activities. This event is set up to prepare everyone for this historic event.

Teresa Kohut and Peggy Allen from Arnold’s Parks and Recreation Department presented their
departments’ ideas to council regarding the event. They are suggesting a festival to be held on August
19" through August 21%. It would include items such as an “eclipse of the sun run”, children’s crafts,

movies, music and inflatables, just to name a few. They would also have eclipse T-shirts and glasses for
sale.

Bryan Richison explained to council that the city has also taken into consideration the possibility of an
increase in traffic congestion and emergency response calls.
Butch Cooley made a motion and so moved to adjourn the meeting. Seconded by EJ Fleischmann.

Voice vote: All yeas.

Meeting adjourned at 7:23 p.m.

[[ O rtrud / /% /

C;ty Clerk Tammi Casey, MRCC




CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI

ROLL CALL
MEETING: WORK SESSION
DATE: 3/9/2017 BILL NO - RESOLUTION - MOTION
PAGE: 1
LLI
o
pzd
<L
o
<
ul
E
<
£
COUNCIL MEMBERS:
MAYOR RON COUNTS PRESENT
COUNCIL: EJ FLEISCHMANN PRESENT
COUNCIL: BRIAN MCARTHUR PRESENT
COUNCIL: BUTCH COOLEY PRESENT
COUNCIL: DAVID OWENS EXCUSED
COUNCIL: PHIL AMATO PRESENT
COUNCIL: JASON FULBRIGHT PRESENT
COUNCIL: VERN SULLIVAN PRESENT
COUNCIL: GARY PLUNK PRESENT
CITY
ADMINISTRATOR BRYAN RICHISON PRESENT |PARKS DIR: -
CITY CLERK TAMMI CASEY PRESENT [PUBLIC WORKS: ED BLATTNER PRESENT
ARRIVED
COM DEV MARY HOLDEN EXCUSED |TREASURER: DAN KROUPA 7:03
CITY ATTORNEY BOB SWEENEY PRESENT |[POLICE DEPT. CHIEF SHOCKEY PRESENT




6.A, B, C,
D ANDE

CITY OF ARNOLD, CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
FROM: MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR

SUBJECT: ADOPTION OF THE 2015 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING, RESIDENTIAL,
PROPERTY MAINTANENCE, PLUMBING, MECHANICAL, FUEL AND GAS,
AND 2014 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE

DATE: MARCH 31, 2017
CC:

Staff is pleased to present five ordinances for the Council consideration and adoption of the 2015
International Building, Residential, Property Maintenance, Plumbing, Mechanical, Fuel and Gas and the
2014 National Electrical Code.

The ninety (90) day review petiod was advertised at the end of December 2016. Our Building
Comrmissioner along with Staff has worked on the review and drafting of the amendments that take
mnto consideration quite a few of the Home Builders Association suggested changes to the codes.

Please note, the 2015 Fuel and Gas code 1s a new addition and Staff recommends it’s adoption.



BILL NO. 2659 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 500, SECTION 500.020 OF
THE CODE OF ORDINANCES AMENDING THE BUILDING CODE,

THE RESIDENTIAL CODE AND THE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE

CODE.

WHEREAS, the international building code, international residential code and the
property maintenance code have been updated in 2015; and

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of these
updates; and

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 500, Section 500.020 is hereby repealed and replaced with the
following;:

“A.  International Building Code. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file
in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Amold, Missouri, being marked and
designated as "The International Building Code, 2016 Edition" and appendices E, G, H
and I as published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted as the Building
Code of the City of Amold, Missouri regulating and governing the conditions and
maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for
supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure
that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the condemnation of
buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and the demolition of such
structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms
of said Building Code on file in the office of the City of Amold are hereby referred to,
adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise
modified by this Chapter.

1. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code requiring the issuance
of certificates of use and occupancy, such certificates shall be termed certificates of
compliance.

2. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code to the contrary,
procedures for giving notice of unsafe conditions and correction orders shall be as
provided in the International Property Maintenance Code 2015, except in the case of
declaration of nuisance. Procedures for giving notice of declaration of nuisance shall be
as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code.



3. Notwithstanding provisions in the International Building Code to the contrary, the right
to appeal orders to correct unsafe conditions shall be as provided in the International
Property Maintenance Code 2015, except as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code in the
case of dangerous buildings.

4. Amendments to the International Building Code 2015.

a. Section B105.5 and B105.6 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"Section 105.5 Expiration, extension, revocation of permits shall be administered in
accordance with Section 500.060, Article I, Chapter S00, Amold Code of Ordinances."

b. Section B108.6 Refunds is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"Section 109.6 — Refunds: Shall be administered in accordance with the adopted
building department fee schedule."

c. Section B113.4 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

"114.4 — Violations Penalties: Shall be governed as prescribed in Section 500.070,
Article I, Chapter 500, Armold Code of Ordinances."

d. Section B115 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

"116 — Unsafe Structures and Equipment: Shall be defined and administered in
accordance with Chapter 515, Amold Code of Ordinances."

e. Section B112.3 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

"113.3 — The Board of Appeals: Shall consist of members appointed by the Mayor in
accordance with Section 500.120, Article I, Chapter 500, of the Amold Code of
Ordinances."

f. Section B201.4 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

"201.4 Terms not defined: Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized
by this Section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context
implies or failing that as ascribed in the Webster's Tenth New Collegiate Dictionary, as
revised."

g. Section B3412.2 Applicability is hereby amended by inserting the date of (October
2, 1972) as the effective date of Building Codes within the City of Arnold, Missouri.

B. International Residential Code. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file
in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Amold, Missouri, being marked and
designated as "The International Residential Code, 2015 Edition" and appendices A,
B,C,D,E,G,H, [,J, K, No, O, P, Q, and U as published by the International Code
Council is hereby adopted as the Residential Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri
regulating and governing the construction, alteration, movement, enlargement,
replacement, repair, equipment, location, removal and demolition of detached one-
and two-family dwellings and multiple single-family dwellings (town houses) not
more than three (3) stories in height with separate means of egress as herein
provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and
each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said
Residential Code on file in the office of the City of Armold are hereby referred to,
adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise
modified by this Chapter.



1. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Residential Code requiring the
issuance of certificates of use and occupancy, such certificates shall be termed certificates
of compliance.

2. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Residential Code to the contrary,
procedures for giving notice of unsafe conditions and correction orders shall be as
provided in the International Property Maintenance Code 2015, except in the case of
declaration of nuisance. Procedures for giving notice of declaration of nuisance shall be
as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code.

3. Notwithstanding provisions in the International Residential Code to the contrary, the
right to appeal orders to correct unsafe conditions shall be as provided in the International
Property Maintenance Code 2015, except as provided in Chapter 515 of this Code in the
case of dangerous buildings.

4. Amendments to the International Residential Code 2015:

a. Section 101.1 Title is amended by inserting "The City of Amold".

b. Section 102.5 Appendices is amended by the addition of Section 102.5.1
Appendices adopted as follows:
"Section 102.5.1 Appendices Adopted. Appendix H is hereby adopted as part of this
code."

c. Section 105.5 and 105.6 is amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"105.5 Expiration, extension, revocation of permits shall be administered in accordance
with Section 500.060, Article I, Chapter 500, Amold Code of Ordinances."

d. Section 113.1 and R11.33 is deleted without replacement.

e. Section 113.3 is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:
"112.3 The Board of Appeals shall consist of members appointed by the Mayor in
accordance with Section 500.120, Article I, Chapter 500, of the Arnold Code of
Ordinances."

f. Table 301.2 (1) Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria is completed by the
establishment and insertion of the following design criteria:
Ground snow load 20 PSF

Wind speed 90 MPH

Seismic design category D,0

Weathering Severe

Frost line depth 30 inches

Termite Moderate to heavy

Winter design temp 6 degrees F

Ice shield yes

Flood hazards Date of current FIRM panels (April 05, 2006)
Air freezing index 0 — 1,000

Mean annual temp. 54 degrees F

g. 302.13 Fire Protection Floors: Amend as follows:
Section 3.1:The aggregate area of the unprotected floor assembly does not exceed 100
square feet per HVAC zone. Section 3.2:Areas of the floor assembly covered by HVAC



metal plenum, trunk lines, and steel structural beams shall be considered protected.
Gypsum wallboard membrane shall be installed as close as possible to the above listed

items.

h. Section 306 is amended to add the following:
306.5 Floor Drain. All basements shall have a floor drain within ten (10) feet of the
heating/cooling system(s) and water heater. The floor drain shall comply with Chapter

27.

1. 311.7.5 Landings for stairways shall be amended as follows: There shall be a
floor or landing at the top or bottom of each stairway. A top landing is not required
where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the exterior side of the door,
provided that door does not swing over the stairway.

Exception: A floor or landing is not required at the top of an interior or exterior flight of
stairs, including stairs in an enclosed garage, provided a door does not swing over the
stairs. A flight of stairs shall not have a vertical rise larger than twelve (12) feet (3,685
mm) between floor levels or landings. The width of each landing shall not be less than
the width of the stairway served. Every landing shall have a minimum dimension of
thirty- six (36) inches (914 mm) measured in the direction of travel. For remodeling
projects in existing homes, stair tread and riser will be allowed to mimic previous or
existing conditions.

j. Section 403.1(4) Light frame construction table is added .
Table 403.1(4)

Minimum Width of Concrete, Precast, or Masonry Footings (inches)
for Light-Frame Construction with Pre-Fabricated Roof Trusses®"¢

Load-Bearing Value of Soil (psf)
1500 l 2000 l 3000 | >4000
Conventional light-frame construction with pre-fabricated trusses
1 story 12 12 12 12
2 story 15 12 12 12
3 story 23] Py 12 2
4-inch brick veneer over light frame or 8-inch hollow concrete masonry
1 story 12 12 12 12
2 story 21 16 12 12
3 story 32 24 16 12,
8-inch solid or fully grouted masonry
1 story 16 j 12 12
2 story 29 21 14 12
3 story 42 32 21 16

For SI: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1 pound per sguag foot = 0.0479 kITz;

a. Spread footings shall be same thickness as the wall (minimum of 8 inches).




b. Where minimum footing width is 12 inches, use of a single wythe of solid or fully
grouted 12-inch nominal concrete masonry units is permitted.
¢. Snow Load or Roof Live Load shall not exceed 20 psf. If load exceeds 20 psf,

designs must be completed by a licensed design professional.

k. Section 404.1.3.2: Amend as follows:

Table 404.1.2(10) Concrete Foundation Walls

Maximum Wall Height | Maximum Depth of Unbalanced Backfill Minimum Nominal Wall Thickness
D 6’-0” or less 8”

0" 7°-0” 10 (Note a)

6’-0 or less 8” (Note a)

83_035 7’-—0” 8” “:]Ote a!

8’-0” 8” (Note a)

6°-0” or less 10” (Note b

. 7-0” 10” (Note b
20 8’-0” 10” (Note b)

9’-0” 10” (Note b

Note a: Concrete foundation walls may be constructed a minimum of nominal 8
inches thick where the wall height from the top of the footing to the top of
the wall does not exceed 8 feet. A minimum of two #4 reinforcing bars shall
be placed horizontally in the top and bottom of the foundation wall. A
minimum of two #5 reinforcing bars shall be provided around all window
and door openings in concrete foundation and basement walls: bars shall

extend a minimum of 24 inches beyond the comners of the openings.
Note b: Concrete foundation walls may be constructed a minimum of nominal 10

inches thick. A minimum of two #5 reinforcing bars shall be placed
horizontally in the top, middle, and bottom of the foundation wall. A

minimum of two #5 reinforcing bars shall be provided around all window

and door openings in concrete foundation and basement walls: bars shall

extend a minimum of 24 inches beyond the comers of the openings.

The concrete minimum nominal wall thickness shall be 8 inches for foundation walls
in soil classes SC, MH. ML-CL and inorganic CL when the maximum wall height is
8 feet.

The concrete minimum wall thickness shall be 10 inches for foundation walls in soil
classes SC, MH, ML-CL and inorganic CL when the maximum wall height is 9 feet.

The concrete minimum wall thickness shall be 12 inches for foundation walls in soil
classes SC, MH, ML-CL and inorganic CL when the maximum wall height is 10 feet.

1. Section 507.2.4 Deck lateral load connection. Is amended by the addition of an
exception as follows:




Exception: All decks that are 100 square feet or less.

m. Section 602.7.5 Supports for headers. Revise as follows: Headers shall be
supported on each end with one or more jack studs or with approved framing anchors in
accordance with Table 602.7(1) or 602.7.(2). The full-height stud adjacent to each end of
the header shall be end nailed to each end of the header with four-16d nails (3.5 inches x
0.135 inches). The minimum number of full-height studs at each end of a header shall be
in accordance with Table R602.7.5.

Table R602.7.5
Minimum Number of Full Height Studs at Each End of Headers in Exterior Walls?
Header Span Maximum Stud Spacing (inches)
(feet) [per Table R602.3 (5)

6 £

3 1 -

40 2 +

8 3 E

122 5 3

16> 6 4

Ultimate Design Wind Speed and Exposure Category

Maximum Header Span

feet <140mph. Exposure B
et or <130mph, Exposure C =115mph, Exposure B”

4 L 1
6 2 1
8 2 1
10 3 2
12 3 2
14 3 2
16 s 2
18 4 2

a. For header spans between those given above, use the minimum number of full-
height studs associated with the larger header span.

b. The tabulated minimum number of full-height studs is applicable where jack

studs are provided to support the header at each end in accordance with Table




R602.7.(1). Where a framing anchor is used to support the header in lieu of a
jack stud in accordance with footnote “d” of Table R602.7.(1), the minimum
number of full-height studs at each end of a header shall be in accordance with
requirements for wind speed <140mph, Exposure B.

n. Section 602.12 Simplified Bracing shall be amended as follows:
Item 3:Wall height shall not be greater than a nominal 12 feet when using the minimum
required bracing lengths specified in Table 602.12.4.,

0. Section 602.12.2 Sheathing materials:
Item 1. Change “3/8” to “7/16”.

p. Chapter 11,Section N: Delete in its entirety except: (Section N1102.2.13:
Sunrooms) (Section N1102.4.2: Fireplaces) ( Section N1102.4.4: Fuel Burning
Appliances) (Section N1108.1(R502.1) Additions) (Section N1109.1 (R503.1)
Alterations) ( Section 1111.2: (R505.2) Change of Occupancy).

q. M1305.1.4.1 Ground clearance. Is amended as follows: Equipment and
appliances supported from the ground shall be level and firmly supported on a concrete
slab or other approved material extending not less than two (2) inches above the
adjoining ground. Such support shall be in accordance with the manufacture's installation
instructions. Appliances suspended from the floor shall have a clearance of not less than
six (6) inches from the ground.

r. Section M1301.2,M1301.3,M1301.4,M1301.5 General Mechanical System
Requirements: Omit in its entirety.

s. Section M1307.2 Anchorage of appliances: Omit in its entirety.

t. Section M1401.3 Equipment and appliance sizing: Amended as follows.
Heating and cooling equipment shall be sized in accordance with ACCA Manual J
or other approved heating and cooling calculation methodologies.

u. Section M1502.4.2 Duct installation for dryers: Omit the following:
(and shall be mechanically fastened or with similar fasteners that protrude into the
inside of the duct.)

v. Section M2105.4 Piping and tubing materials standards: Amend and add:

(However, polyvinyl chloride (PVC) and chlorinated polyvinylchloride (CPVC)
shall not be used on geothermal ground loops both inside and underground.)

w. Section N1102.4.3 Fireplaces. Is amended to read: New wood-burning fireplaces

shall have outdoor combustion air.

C. Property Maintenance Code. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file in



the office of the City Clerk of the City of Arnold, Missouri, being marked and designated
as "The International Property Maintenance Code, 2015 Edition" and all appendices as
published by the International Code Council is hereby adopted as the Property
Maintenance Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri for regulating and governing the
conditions and maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the
standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical things and conditions
essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use, and the
demolition of such existing structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of
permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions,
conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on file in the office of the City
of Arnold are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Section. Except as otherwise provided in the Code of Ordinances, it shall be the duty of
the Building Inspector to inspect existing structures and exterior property areas in a
manner and to the extent necessary to carry out the provisions of the International
Property Maintenance Code 2015.

1. Inspections of the interior and exterior of structures and premises shall be conducted
upon receipt of written requests for issuance of certificates of compliance. Inspections
may be conducted as the result of observations or complaints of violations of the
International Property Maintenance Code 2015. Inspections conducted as the result of
such observations or complaints shall be limited to the exterior of the structure and its
premises, except in those cases where there are reasonable grounds to believe that a
structure may be a dangerous building as set out in Chapter 515 of this Code. Inspections
of the interior and exterior of structures and premises may also be made upon the written
request of the owner or occupant of a structure.

2. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Property Maintenance Code 2015 to
the contrary, regulation of weeds shall be as provided in Chapter 220, Article I of the
Code of Ordinances.

3. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Property Maintenance Code 2015 to
the contrary, regulation of motor vehicles shall be as provided in Chapter 220 of the Code
of Ordinances.

4. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Property Maintenance Code 2015 to
the contrary, a family shall be defined as provided in the zoning ordinance, except that
foster children shall be included within the definition of family.

5. Amendments to the International Property Maintenance Code 2015:
a. Section 106.4 Penalty. Is hereby amended to read in its entirety as follows:

Violations, Penalties shall be governed as prescribed in Section 500.070, Article I,
Chapter 500, Arnold Code of Ordinances.



b. Section 107.1 Notice to owner is hereby amended to read in its entirety as
Sfollows:
107.1 Notice to owner or to person or persons responsible: Whenever the Code official
determines that there has been a violation of this code or has grounds to believe that a
violation has occurred, notice shall be given to the owner or the person or persons
responsible therefore in the manner prescribed in Chapter 515, Arnold Code of
Ordinances.

c. Section 111.2 Membership of Board. Is hereby amended to read in its entirety
as follows:
The Board of Appeals shall consist of members appointed by the Mayor in accordance
with Section 500.120, Article I, Chapter 500, of the Arnold Code of Ordinances.

d. Section 304.3 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph, 304.3.1,
enacted in the following words:
“304.3.1 Color, Location, Material. All numbers required by Section 304.3 shall be of a
contrasting color to the background upon which they are affixed. Numbers shall be
permanently affixed with standard hardware items, no adhesives, temporary fasteners
such as wire, velcro or other means shall be accepted. Numbers shall be located within
six (6) feet of the main entry door or immediately over the garage door. When the
numbered structure is located more than one-hundred (100) feet from the right-of-way, or
the required number location does not face the right-of-way, or the numbers are obscured
by intervening landscaping, topography or other structures or features, the numbers shall
be displayed adjacent to the driveway or entrance to the premises and in the form and
fashion as herein stated, in addition to being displayed on the structure.”

e. Section 304.14 is hereby amended by inserting the dates of (April 1 to
December 1).

/- Section 308.2 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 308.2.1,
as follows:

Section 308.2.1. Inspection and Extermination Log. The owner of any multiple residential
occupancy structure shall be responsible for the accurate maintenance of an inspection
and extermination log. The extermination log shall indicate as a minimum the name of
the extermination company, the date of their inspection, unit, or grounds that were
treated, any notorious observations of rodents or insects, and any complaints from
occupants regarding infestation. The log shall be available for inspection by the
Community Development Director at all times during normal business hours. The log is
subject to periodical review as required to confirm compliance with Section 308.2. An
Occupancy Permit shall not be issued when it is found that the structure or portion
thereof has not been exterminated in accordance with Section P308.2.

g. Section 602.3 is hereby amended by inserting the dates of (September 1 to
May 31).



h. Section 602.4 is hereby amended by inserting the dates of (September 1 to
May 31).

1. Section 605.2 is hereby amended in its entirety as follows:
P605.2. Receptacles. Every habitable space in a dwelling shall contain at least two (2)
separate and remote receptacle outlets. Every laundry area shall contain at least one (1)
grounded type receptacle. Every bathroom shall contain at least one (1) receptacle. All
receptacles in the following locations shall have ground-fault circuit-interrupter
protection for personnel:
(1) All bathroom receptacles.

(2) All garage and grade-level portions of unfinished accessory buildings
used for storage or work areas. Exception No. 1: Receptacles that are not
readily accessible,

Exception No. 2: A single receptacle or a duplex receptacle for two (2)
appliances located within dedicated space for each appliance that, in
normal use, is not easily moved from one place to another, and that is
cord-and plug-connected in accordance with NEC 2014.

(3) Outdoors. Exception: Receptacles that are not readily accessible and
are supplied from a dedicated branch circuit for electric snow-melting or
deicing equipment as covered in Article 426 NEC 2014 shall be permitted
to be installed in accordance with the applicable provisions of Article 426.

(4) Crawl spaces. Where the crawl space is at or below grade level.

(5) Unfinished basements. For purposes of this Section, unfinished
basements are defined as portions or areas of the basement not intended as
habitable rooms and limited to storage areas, work areas, and the like.
Exception No. 1: Receptacles that are not readily accessible.

Exception No. 2: A single receptacle or a duplex receptacle for two (2)
appliances located within dedicated space for each appliance that in
normal use is not easily moved from one place to another, and that is cord-
and plug-connected in accordance with NEC 2014,

(6) Kitchens. Where the receptacles are installed to serve the countertop
surface .

(7) Wet bar sinks. Where the receptacles are installed to serve the
countertop surfaces and are located within six (6) feet of the outside edge
of the wet bar sink.

J. Section 703 is hereby amended by the addition of a new paragraph 703.3
enacted in the following words:
703.3 Private garages. Openings between a private garage, as defined in the Building
Code listed in Chapter 8, and the residence shall be equipped with either solid wood

10



doors not less than 1 3/8 inch in thickness or twenty (20) minute fire rated doors or
equivalent. Further the garage shall be completely separated from the residence and its
attic area by a minimum five-eighths (5/8 type X) inch Gypsum Board or equivalent
applied to the garage side.

k. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code, International
Residential Code and the International Property Maintenance Code 2015 to the contrary,
plumbing installation shall be in accordance with the code adopted in Chapter 505 of the
Code of Ordinances.

1. Notwithstanding provisions of the International Building Code, International
Residential Code and the Intemational Property Maintenance Code 2015 to the contrary,
the appeals board provided in Section 500.120 shall hear all appeals relative to the
enforcement of such codes.

m. Notwithstanding other provisions of the International Property Maintenance
Code 2015 to the contrary, home occupations as defined in the zoning ordinance of the
City of Amold, Missouri, as may from time to time be amended, shall not require an
inspection, nor shall the structure be required to be brought into compliance under the
International Property Maintenance Code 2015 as a condition of the issuance of a
merchants or manufacturers license as required by the ordinances of the City.

n. Section 2503.6 Shower liner test. Is deleted without replacement.

0. Section 2603.4 Pipes through foundation walls: Omit the following,
(The sleeve shall be two pipe sizes greater than the pipe passing through the wall.)

p. Section 2801.8 Water heater bracing: Amend as follows:
Water heaters (can) be strapped if a wall or structure is available to be used.

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage and approval.

READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF ,
207,

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts

ATTEST:

11



City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading:
2nd reading:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney Robert Sweeney

12



BILL NO. 2660 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 503, SECTION 503.010
AND SECTION 503.030 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES
AMENDING THE PLUMBING CODE.

WHEREAS, the national electrical code has been updated; and

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of these
updates; and

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 503, Section 503.010 is hereby repealed and replaced with the
following:

“A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk of the
City of Arnold, Missouri, being marked and designated as "The National Electric Code,
2014 Edition" and all appendices as published by the National Fire Protection
Association is hereby adopted by reference as the Electrical Code for the City of Arnold
and shall govern all electrical work performed on and after the effective date of this
Chapter. Electrical systems lawfully existing on the date of adoption of this Chapter shall
be permitted to continue without change except as is specifically covered by this code,
the Property Maintenance Code, and other building codes adopted, or as is deemed
necessary by the Code Official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and
public; each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of said Electrical
Code on file in the office of the City of Arnold are hereby referred to, adopted and made
a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise modified by this
Chapter.”

Section 2. Chapter 503, Section 503.030 is hereby repealed.
Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage and approval.

READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF 5
2017.

Presiding Officer of the City Council



ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading:
2nd reading:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney Robert Sweeney

Mayor Ron Counts



BILL NO. 2661 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 505, SECTION 505.010
AND SECTION 505.030 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES
AMENDING THE PLUMBING CODE.

WHEREAS, the International Plumbing Code has been updated in 2015; and

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of
these updates; and

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 505, Section 505.010 is hereby repealed and replaced with the
following:

“A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk of the
City of Arnold, Missouri, being marked and designated as "The International Plumbing
Code, 2015 Edition" and appendices C, D, and E as published by the International Code
Council is hereby adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri
regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of
plumbing systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and
collection of fees therefor; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and
terms of said Plumbing Code on file in the office of the City of Arnold are hereby
referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless
otherwise modified by this Chapter.”

Section 2. Chapter 505, Section 505.030 is hereby repealed.
Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage and approval.

READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF ,
2017.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts



ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading:
2nd reading:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney Robert Sweeney



BILL NO. 2662 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 510, SECTION 510.010
AND SECTION 510.020 OF THE CODE OF ORDINANCES
AMENDING THE MECHANICAL CODE.

WHEREAS, the International mechanical Code has been updated in 2015; and

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of
these updates; and

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 510, Section 510.010 is hereby repealed and replaced with the
following:

“A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk of the
City of Amold, Missouri, being marked and designated as "The International Mechanical
Code, 2015 Edition" and all appendices as published by the International Code Council is
hereby adopted as the Mechanical Code of the City of Arnold, Missouri regulating and
governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration,
repair, location, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of mechanical systems as
herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and
each and all of the regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of said Mechanical Code
on file in the office of the City of Arnold are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part
hereof, as if fully set out in this Chapter, unless otherwise modified by this Chapter.”

Section 2. Chapter 510, Section 510.020 is hereby repealed and replaced with the
following:

“A. Section 101.1 is hereby amended by the insertion of (The City of Arnold, Missouri).

B. Section 510.6.5 Make up air required. Is amended to read as: Exhaust hood systems
capable of exhausting in excess of 600 cubic feet per minute shall be provided with
makeup air system, be equipped with a means of closure and shall be automatically
controlled to start and operate simultaneously with the exhaust system.

C. Table 603. Is amended to read as follows:
Min

Size  Thickness Galv. Alum B&S
Type of Duct (in) (in) Gauge Gauge
Round, enclosed rectangular exposed 14 or 0.013 30 26



Min.
Size Thickness Galv. Alum B&S

Type of Duct (in) (in) Gauge Gauge
rectangular less
over 14 0.016 28 24
14 or 0.016 28 24
less
over 14 0.019 26 22

D. Section 603.9 Joints and seams. Joints of duct systems shall be made substantially
airtight in an unconditioned area by means of tapes, mastics, liquid sealants, gasketing or
other approved closure systems. Closure systems used with rigid fibrous glass ducts shall
comply with UL181A and shall be marked 101 A-P for pressure-sensitive tape, 181 A-M
for mastic or 181 AOH for heating-sensitive tape. Closure systems used with flexible air
ducts and flexible air connectors shall comply with UL 181B and shall be marked 181B-
FX for pressure-sensitive tape or 181B-M for mastic. Duct connections to flanges of air
distribution system equipment or sheet metal fittings shall be mechanically fastened.
Mechanical fasteners for use with flexible non-metallic air ducts shall comply with UL
181B and shall be marked 181B-C. Crimp joints for round metal ducts shall have a
contact lap of at least one and one-half (1 1/2) means of at least three sheet-metal screws
or rivets equally spaced around the joint. Closure systems used to seal metal ductwork
shall be installed in accordance with the manufacture's installation instructions.

E. Section 106.2 Permit not required. Is hereby amended by the addition of item "9", as
follows:

9. Repairs, maintenance, and seasonal services of mechanical equipment
and appliance shall not require permits.

F. Section 111 is hereby created titled LICENSING OF MECHANICAL
CONTRACTORS.

111.1. Licenses required.:

a) A person who is not a licensed mechanical contractor or licensed individual shall not

engage in or perform the work pertaining to this code.

b) The "license” as used in this Section means a current valid mechanical contractor or
individual license that has been issued by any one (1) of the following State of
Missouri political subdivisions: City of St. Louis, St. Louis County, Jefferson County,
and St. Charles County. Any mechanical contractor license from another jurisdiction
may be accepted by the Community Development Department upon submission of
satisfactory proof that the license issued by such jurisdiction meets the same licensing

standards of the jurisdictions cited above.



111.1.2. lllegal use of names.

a)

b)

No person shall allow his name fallaciously to be used in or by another person for the
purpose of obtaining permits, or for doing business or work under such mechanical
contractor license. Every licensed person shall notify the Community Development
Department of the address of his place of business and the name under which such
business is conducted. The Community Development Department shall be given
immediate notice of any change in business address or name.

For the purposes of this section, it shall be unlawful for a licensed mechanical
contractor to obtain a mechanical permit and allow another person or persons who is
not individually licensed to complete work under his license. Nothing in this section
shall be construed, however, to prohibit a licensed mechanical contractor from
obtaining a mechanical permit and then subcontracting to another licensed mechanical
contractor or licensed individual, if the subcontractor has all required insurance and
bonding. Such subcontracted work shall similarly be subject to the provisions of this
Section. The building official may require the submission of suitable proof that the
licensed mechanical contractor directly employs the persons performing the
mechanical work and that the person performing the mechanical work is individually
licensed.

111.1.3. Bonding.

a)

Before a permit shall be issued to a person performing in the capacity of a mechanical
contractor, he/she shall be required to file with the Community Development
Department a surety bond in the amount of five thousand dollars ($5,000.00). The
bonds required herein shall be reviewed by the city attorney and shall be conditioned
upon, and shall be given for faithful observance of all ordinances, laws, rules and
regulations adopted for the protection of the public health and safety pertaining to
mechanical installations and shall indemnify the city, or any other governmental
agency or any other person as may be required, for any damage or injury sustained
through the negligence of such mechanical contractor, his servants, agents, or
employees in performing mechanical work and shall indemnify the city, or any other
governmental agency any other person as may be required, for any damages or injury
sustained resulting from the failure to perform mechanical work in a careful and
workmanlike manner in conformity with this Code.

111.2. License Exemption:

The following work shall not require licensing as required by this Section.

a)

A homeowner performing mechanical work on his/her permanent residence.



b) Work on a facility performed by directly employed personnel of the facility owner.

c) System installation, start-up, warranty service or warranty repair work that is
performed by personnel employed, trained and certified by the manufacturer of the
system being serviced, repaired or replaced.

d) Demolition, when the fuel source has been disconnected following industry safety
standards.”

Section 3. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its
passage and approval.

READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF 5
2017.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts

ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading:
2nd reading:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney Robert Sweeney



BILL NO. 2663 ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING CHAPTER 512 OF THE CODE OF
ORDINANCES CREATING A FUEL GAS CODE.

WHEREAS, the International Fuel Gas Code has been updated in 2015; and

WHEREAS, the staff has reviewed the updates and recommends the adoption of
these updates; and

WHEREAS, a public comment period, as required by statute, has been provided;

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 512, is hereby established as follows:
“Section 512.010 International Fuel Gas Code.

A. A certain code, at least one copy of which is on file in the office of the City Clerk
of the City of Armold, Missouri, being marked and designated as "The
International Fuel Gas Code, 2015 Edition" and all appendices as published by the
International Code Council is hereby adopted by reference as the Fuel Gas Code
for the City of Arnold and shall govern the conditions and maintenance of all
property, buildings and structures, to provide the standards for supplied utilities
and facilities and other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that
structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use, and to provide for the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use and
the demolition of such structures or as is deemed necessary by the Code Official
for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and public; each and all of the
regulations, provisions, conditions and terms of said Fuel Gas Code on file in the
office of the City of Arnold are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part
hereof, as if fully set out in this Section, unless otherwise modified by this
Chapter.

Section 512.020 Amendments to the 2105 International Fuel Gas Code.

A. Section 2408.4 (350.7) Clearances from grade. Is amended to read as: Equipment
and appliances installed at grade level shall be supported on a level concrete slab
or other approved material extending not less than two (2) inches above adjoining
grade or shall be suspended not less than six (6) inches above adjoining grade.
Such supports shall be installed in accordance with the manufacture's installation
instructions.

B. Section 2412.9. Is omitted and amended as follows: All gas piping will be
identified with yellow markings or an identification tag approved by the AHJ.



Section 512.030 Violation — Penalties.

A. Whenever in the Code adopted in this Chapter or in any ordinance of the City any
act is prohibited or is made or declared to be unlawful or an offense, or whenever
in such Code or ordinance the doing of any act is required or the failure to do any
act is declared to be unlawful, where no specific penalty is provided therefore, the
violation of any such provision of this Code or ordinance shall be punished by a
fine not exceeding five hundred dollars ($500.00) or imprisonment for not more
than ninety (90) days, or both.

B. Each day any violation of any provision of this Code or of any such ordinance
shall continue shall constitute a separate offense.

C. In addition to the penalty hereinabove provided, any condition caused or
permitted to exist in violation of any of the provisions of this Code or any such
ordinance shall be deemed a public nuisance and may be, by the City, abated as
provided by law, and each day that such condition continues shall be regarded as
a new and separate offense.

D. The term "misdemeanor", wherever the same may be used in this Code of
Ordinances, shall be construed to mean and to stand in lieu of the words "a
violation of this Code of Ordinances”.

Section 512.040 through Section 512.400. (Reserved)”

Section 2. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its
passage and approval.

READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS DAY OF
2017.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts

ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading:



2nd reading:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attomey Robert Sweeney



TA

CITY OF ARNOLD, CITY COUNCIL
ARPIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: MAYOR COUNTS AND CITY COUNCIL

FROM: CHRISTIE HULL BETTALE

SUBJECT: EASEMENT VACATION FOR RAISING CANES
DATE: 3/31/2017

ce: BYRAN RICHISON AND MARY HOLDEN

REQUEST

Premier Civil Engineeting requested a vacation 2~5 foot easements along an old platted

property line.

ANALYSIS

The portion of easement exists along an old ptroperty line that bisected the cutrent
Raising Canes Patcel. Attached for reference are the request, vacation document, and
exhibit.  Staff has investigated the request and the City does not have infrastructure located
within the easement. The easement in this location 1s not needed and will not be of benefit

to the City in the future. Public Works is in agreement with the recommendation.

The approval by Council will vacate the City’s use of the easement. The applicant is

coordinating with other utilities separately for their approvals as needed.
RECOMMENDATION

Staff recommends approval of the request.



AGENDA ITEM

TA

RESOLUTION NO. 17-09

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE RELEASE OF
AN EASEMENT

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Arnold, Missouri, that the Mayor is
hereby authorized to execute the vacation of 2~5 foot easements on Lot Line between
Lots a & B of HBH Properties Subdivision as recorded in PB 78 PG 26 of the Jefferson
County records, City of Amnold, Jefferson County Missouri. A copy of the easement
vacation document and plat exhibit is attached hereto and made a part hereof by
reference.

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

Date:

3/31/2017
ZACITYDOCS\RESOLUTN\17-XX Vacate @Raising Caines



PREMIER CIVIL
ENGINEERING

308 TCW CourT
LAKE ST. Louis, MO 63367

February 10, 2017

Mayor Ron Counts
City of Arnold, MO
2101 Jeffco Blvd.

Arnold, MO 63010

Re: Easement Vacation Request
HBH Properties Subdivision
Project No. 163201

Mayor Counts,

Attached for your review is an exhibit to vacate the 5° wide easements in the HBH Properties
Subdivision. Please consider this submittal as a request by the owner for consideration for the
vacation of the said easements.

Should you require any additional information or have any questions, please call 314-925-7453.

Sincerely,

Debbie L. Stosz

Engineering . Land Surveying . Landscape Architecture
308 TCW Court " Lake Saint Louis, MO 63367 = Phone: 314-925-7444



TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN:

Easement Vacation by and between BIPA. LLC and The City of Arnold. MO.

We hereby request the vacation of portions of the 5’ wide easements on the Lot Line
between Lots A & B of HBH Properties Subdivision, a subdivision recorded as Plat Book
78 Page 26 of the Jefferson County records, said portions of existing easements are shown as
hachured on the attached "Exhibit A".

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the above named parties have signed these presents this

day of 2017.
BIPA, LLC City of Amold, MO.
William S. Hale, Member Ron Counts, Mayor
Notary Date

Engineering = Land Surveying . Landscape Architecture
308 TCW Court " Lake Saint Louis, MO 63367 = Phone: 314-925-7444



RAISING CANE'S — ARNOLD, MISSOURI

L=25.48'(S) 25.67'(R), R=523.70,
CH=25.48", N32'57'53"W
WATER TOWER PLACE LOTS
10A AND 124, A
BOUNDARY LINE
ADJUSTMENT
PB. 220, PG. 26 L=155.55'(S)
155.36'(R),
R=523.70,
CH=154.98',
S23°03'42"E
LOT A o
5'W EASEMENT PER =
PB 78 PG 26 § C
TO BE VACATED =
oy
™ @
Y 'a.:‘-%-i
ok o
O_ é a ?
e é = o v
NS bz \Uﬂ w o
(o) . ™ A~
AN < oI \é o o
A\ LOT B €% z -
O e 6 L=236.05'(S)
> @ & 2 235.77'(R),
N N 3 - |—R=523.70,
’ ' \;; CH=234.06",
A \ "; S01°38'24"E
2\ |
EASEMENT AREA N ,/ A\ | 3
TO BE VACATED y h \ | ’g
/ 3
2\
/ N\ \ |
LOT 9 \ l
THE RESUBDIVISION OF LOT 5A OF \ /
"RESUBDIVISION OF LOTS 5 AND 6 \/
OF WATER TOWER PLACE' PB.110 L
PG.26 & 27, LOT 3 OF 'WATER 1"=50
TOWER PLACE’ PB.107 PG.18 & 19, 0 25 50
AND LOTS 3,4 AND 5 OF 'HARRY E
J. FREDERITZL'S SIXTH p
SUBDIVISION' PB.28 PG.23
PE. 194 PG 10 SCALE IN FEET
EXHIBIT "A" / INITIAL:
EASEMENT VACATION EXHIBIT
A TRACT OF LAND BEING LOTS A AND B OF 'HBH PROPERTIES SUBDIVISION' AS RECORDED
IN PLAT BOOK 78, PAGE 26 AND BEING PART OF U.S. SURVEY 2991, TOWNSHIP 43 NORTH,
RANGE 6 EAST, JEFFERSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

JANUARY 3, 2016




STATE of MISSOURI
)SS
COUNTY of JEFFERSON

On this day of , 2017, before me appeared

William S. Hale, member of BIPA, LLC a Missouri limited liability company to me known to be the
person described in, and who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged said instrument to
be the free act and deed of said limited liability company.

In Testimony, Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal the day and year last
above written.

Notary Public
Print Name
My Commission Expires:
STATE of MISSOURI
)SS
COUNTY of JEFFERSON
On this day of , 2017, before me appeared

Ron Counts, Mayor with the City of Arnold, Missouri to me known to be the person described in, and
who executed the foregoing instrument, and acknowledged said instrument to be the free act and deed
of said limited liability company.

In Testimony, Whereof, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed my official seal the day and year last
above written.

Notary Public

Print Name

My Commission Expires:

Engineering . Land Surveying . Landscape Architecture
308 TCW Court = Lake Saint Louis, MO 63367 = Phone: 314-925-7444



7B

CITY OF ARNOLD, CITY COUNCIL
APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: MAYOR COUNT AND CITY COUNCIL
FROM: CHRISTIE HULL BETTALE

SUBJECT: RESOLUTION FOR CONTRACT WITH SPENCER CONTRACTING —
SAFE ROUTES TO SCHOOL, TENBROOK ROAD PROJECT

DATE: 3/31/2017
CC: BYRAN RICHISON AND MARY HOLDEN

The City staff advertised a Request for Bid for Constructing Tenbrook Road
Sidewalk Improvements and the bid opening was February 21, 2017. Six tesponses were
received. Spencer Contracting, an Arnold, Missouri, MoDOT cettified contractor was the
lowest bid. The total bid amount and the proposed total contract amount is $319,351.16. The
second low bidder was RV Wagner. Attached is the bid tabulation.

The low bid received by Spencer Contracting was about $87k below the Horner &
Shifrin construction cost estimate. The second low bid from RV Wagner was about $23k
below the Horner & Shiftin construction cost estimate. These bids should validate the final
Horner & Shifrin construction cost estimate ($406,397.90). The Disadvantage Business
Enterprise (DBE) goal is 11%. The lowest and second lowest bidders appear to have met
this DBE goal.

The MoDOT concutrence in award for contract was received 3/8/17.

The City’s current Budget Balance for the project is $309,115.10. Federal grant
funding is approved for $250,000.00 any costs above the federal grant amount (fot
construction and construction services) will be the responsibility the local public agency, as
budgeted.

After contracts are executed, a pre-construction meeting with the City, Contractor,
MoDOT, utilities and Horner & Shifrin will be scheduled at the City of Arnold’s office
followed by a site visit.

Staff requests the City of Arnold City Council approve the Resolution to execute the
contract with Spencer Contracting. Attached is the Spencer Contracting bid.



RESOLUTION NO. 17-10 AGENDA ITEM

7B

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO
A CONTRACT WITH SPENCER CONTRACTING
TO PROVIDE CONSTRUCTION SERVICES FOR
TENBROOK SIDEWALKS (PROJECT SRTS-INF-H32F(105))

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Amold, Missouri, that the Mayor be
and 1s hereby authorized to enter into a contract agreement with Spencer Contracting to
provide construction services for the Tenbrook Sidewalks and improvements in the
amount of the actual costs incurred plus a predetermined fixed fee of $319,351.16.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

Date:

March 9, 2017
17-xx Award Resolution Tenbrook Sidewalks Bid and Contract



IZED BID FORM
Tenbrook Road Sidewalk Impraovements

UNE | ITEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL
ROADWAY ITEMS:
1 2022010 REMOVAL OF .mmovsusms Ls 1 25290~ 5 S29¢ -
2 2071000 unumnf\uma CLASS 1 STA 2% Jo/ 3 =~ | 25 32s."
3 3040504 TYPE 5 AGGREGATE BASE (4 1. THICK] sy 667 q‘ & 2 é 2 5?5 79
¢ 4011200 BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MIXTURE PG5422 P-1) TN e | D A §385,7
5 4073000 BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT MIXTURE PG64-22 {BASE) TON 766 f‘;fﬁ, o3 / o ,} 2 4‘ )’a
6. £071005 TACK COAT GAL 20 -7 o X7
7 4081010 PRIME-LIQUID ASPHALT RC 70 OR MC 3 GAL 139 ey T
8 5021106 CONCRETE PAVEMENT (€ IN. NON-REINFORCED) sy a2 é z e 2 L’ q ‘ 80 . ?&'
® 6039902 ADJUST TO GRADE WATER METER EACH 1 /55, 25 /55 23
10 6038903 ADJUST TO GRADE WATER VALVE EACH 1 143, 75 /3, 75
" 6042010 ADJUSTING MANHOLE EACH 3 5;: 2 S0 / ‘5—5 2 s 50
12 6049902 ADJUST TO GRADE SINGLE CURE INLET WATH NEW INLET STONE EACH 4 9@ 2. 3 ‘y?/f =
13 6045903 ADJUST TO GRADE DOUBLE CURB INLET WITH NEW INLET STONE EACH 1 S5 35" /b 35 "
14 8079302 REMOVAL AND RELOCATION OF MAILBOX EACH 2 25" ? oo,
18 6089202 SINGLE INLET FLUME EACH 4 /;/; o - 5 é co. -
1% BOBZI05 DOUBLE INLET FLUME EACH 1 ] £5 - JSEE "
17 6091010 CONCRETE CURE (6 IN, HEIGHT) TYPE 5 LF 2540 .2 4' - i‘ O, -
18 6022021 INTEGRAL CURB {OVER € IN. KEIGHT) TYPE A LF 43 é ) ?0 3,‘2‘81 1o -
18 6131014 FULL DEPTH PAVEMENT SAWCUT LF 3187 / ﬁ/&’ 17/ % /g , 7 ‘
20 £149202 15 IN. PVC SURFACE DRAINAGE INLET EACH ! i q", - f’?"ofl r
21 169301 CHANNELIZING DEVISE Ls 1 3 4 %’9’ -l 22 g%{ .
2 6169905 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS 8 1 §e2 52 L2 ,5%
23 5181000 MOBILIZATION s 1 9'/5& -~ y"ff? -
24 6274000 CONTRAGTOR FURNISHED SURVEYING AND STAKING Ls 1 > 590" 7580,
25 R 18 IN. PIPE GROUF A LF 2 /';p o, P yﬂ, -
26 7269303 BIN.PVC LF 165 3 g <3 SM , =7
27 73206184 18 1. OR ALLOWED SUBSTITUTE GROUP A FLARED END SECTION EACH 1 4'5L, il Y5h S s
28 7379902 POP-UP EMITTER LF 5 25~ 395 -
-~ - GURE INLET GHECK EACH 16 8 éﬁ o5 /3B, -~

lof2




LINE | ITEM NUMBER DESCRIPTION UNIT | QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE TOTAL
30 8051019 SKT FENCE LF 5553 2.14% // &Z Vor
J
3t 8061022 [TYPE K DITCH CHECK EACH 3 /124 5" ) o 5@
- r .
PAVEMENT MARKING:
32 6208008 |4 IN WHITE ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT LF 2457 / ‘ < 40 P {
o+
33 62050078 |4 N, YELLOW ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT LF 222 /. L5 5 ‘ £ 5’,
” !
34 6205106 ACRYLIC WATERBORNE PAVEMENT MARKING PAINT, € IN., WHITE LF 128 Z2.75 35¢ br 4 {
LANDSCAPING/S TREETSCAPING:
35 6071011A  [CHAIN-LINK FENGE (4B IN.} LF 30 ‘?’5 /5 A 574 o
rl 2
36 BO51000A  |SEEDING - COOL SEASON MIXTURES ACRE 02 JS5oce.” 59@9 =
PEDESTRIAN FACILITIES:
a7 6081010 [CONCRETE CURB RAMP sy 510 ¢ &2 ;5074 2t
[ *
38 6051012 |TRUNGATED DOMES sF 305 7 25 2L/ 25
3 ©085004  |GONGRETE SIDEWALK 4 IN sy 803 S0 /0 Y230, 0
L
a0 6089905  |CONCRETE SIDEWALK, ON CLLVERT sy 12 S5 Jo20. "
L s
o e 78 s Hiywoges N sk RS 71935/ %
T 9anz ek Tee Doz V-l | |

20f2




To: Tim Spencer Spencer Contracting From: 2-17-17 12:36pn p. 1 of 2

TENBROOK ROAD SIDEWALK - ADDENDUM #1
City of Arnold, MO
Federal Project SRTS-INF-H32F(105)
February 17, 2017

This addendum is hereby made part of the contract documents of the above referenced
project. This addendum supplements and/or amends the originally issued documents
and all related addenda.

The City of Arnold is making the following modifications and/or clarifications to the
contract documenis for this project:

1. A queslion was posed at the pre-bid meeting asking if there would be an option
for the sidewalk to be poured monolithic with the adjacent curb. The City's
response is the sidewalk must be poured separate as indicated in the drawings.

2. Some areas of the specifications indicate the bid guaranty shall meet the
requirements of Seclion 102 of the Missouri Standard Specifications for Highway
Construction. Section 102 refers to a bid guaranty amount of no less than 5% of
the amount of the bid. However, the amount of the bid guarantee for this project
shall be no less than 10% of the amount of the bid as stated on the Invitation for

Bids.
Attachments:

e Pre-Bid Meeting sign-in sheet.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDUM #1

The bidder will acknowledge receipt of this Addendum and acceptance of its conditions
by signing this Addendum and including it with the bid.

snsmru@@ —

TITLE: Project Manager

COMPANY: Spencer Contracting Co.

DATE: 2-17-17




RESOLUTION NO: 17-11

A RESOLUTION APPOINTING TRISHA MCCUTCHEN TO THE HISTORIC
PRESERVATION COMMISSION

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Arnold, Missouri, that Trish McCutchen is
hereby appointed to the Historic Preservation Commission to serve the remainder of a
one-year term, terminating on November 1, 2017 or until a successor has been
appointed and qualified.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

Date:

April 6, 2017
Z\CITYDOCS\RESOLUTN\17-11 Trisha McCutchen 2017.doc






AGENDA ITEM
CITY OF ARNOLD

AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY

7D

NAME OF TOPIC/PROJECT: Restriping of a section of Old Lemay Ferry Road from Pearl Drive to
Pomme Road.

SUMMARY EXPLANATION: Restriping of the referenced section of Old Lemay Ferry Road to
improve traffic flow through the area with the removal of existing
street striping.

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Approval

Why is this action necessary? City Council needs to approve the contract agreement with the
striping contractor to undertake this work.

What does this action accomplish? Restripe the Old Lemay Ferry pavement from Pomme
Road to Pearl Drive.

Positive impacts and to whom? The general public who drive on Old Lemay Ferry Road.
Negative impacts and to whom? None that we are aware of.

ADDITIONAL COMMENTS:

SUMMARY OF VENDOR/CONSULTANT/CONTRACTOR

Name: TraMar Contracting, Inc. Previous city contracts: No
Transaction amount: $16,832.50 MBE/WBE Participation: N/A
Transaction type: Contract

Comments:

SUMMARY OF SELECTION PROCESS
Number of bidders: One Low bid: $16,832.50 High bid: No other bids

Comments:

SUMMARY OF BUDGET/COST
Budgeted amount: NA Addl. funding required: Not at this time

Comments:




RESOLUTION NO. 17-12

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO A
CONTRACT WITH TRAMAR CONTRACTING, INC. TO PROVIDE
STREET STRIPING SERVICES FOR A SECTION OF OLD LEMAY FERRY
ROAD FOR THE CITY OF ARNOLD.

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Arnold, Missouri, that the Mayor be, and is
hereby authorized to enter into a contract with TraMar Contracting, Inc. to undertake the
restriping of a section of Old Lemay Ferry Road for the City of Arnold.

A copy of said contract is attached hereto and made a part hereof reference.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk, Tammi Casey

Date:

ZA\CITYDOCS\RESOLUTNA17-12 TRAMAR CONTRACTING 2017.doc
April 6,2017



BID PROPOSAL FORM
CITY OF ARNOLD, MISSOURI
OLD LEMAY FERRY ROAD-STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT

TO: CITY OF ARNOLD
ARNOLD, MISSOURI

Pursuant to and in compliance with your Request for Bids dated M- 72, 2017 and the
other documents related thereto, the undersigned hereby proposes to furnish all tools,
labor, equipment and material and perform all work necessary for undertaking the OLD
LEMAY FERRY ROAD-STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT all required by and in
strict conformance with the Bid Specifications and addendaNo. _~  to_~ inclusive at
the unit & lump sum prices listed herein.

NOTE: Each Street Striping work total price will be determined by actual iﬁ place field
measured quantities. The Contractor and the City shall measure and record quantities
jointly to determine the final total cost.

SECTION 1: Removal of Existing Pavement Markings $ _4,000.00
Four Thousand & 00/100 Dollars
SECTION 2:
Four (4) inch Yellow LF Solid Line 1,286 feet $ 1,286.00 One Thousand Two Hundred
. . ‘ o Eight-six & 00/100 Dollars
Six (6) inch White Solid Line 2,662 feet $ 5,324.00 Five Thousand Three Hundred
. . Twenty-four & 00/100 Dollars
Twenty-four (24) inch White Pvmt Mk 29 feet $ 145.00 One Hundred Forty-Five &
_ , 00/100 Doll
Twelve (12) inch White Pvmt Mk 951 feet § S0 T Thosiail s ke
Seventy-seven & 00/100
SECTION 3: Type 2 Preformed marking Tape (Grooved)
Left / Right Arrows (2 each) $ 700.00 Seven Hundredy & 00/100
Dollars

SECTION 4: Provide all MUTCD work zone signage, construction barrels, flagmen & other as

required $ 1,500.00 One Thousand Five Hundred &
007100 Dollars
SECTION 5: Temporary paving marking tape $ 1,500.00 One Thousand Five Hundred &
007100
TOTAL COST SECTIONS 1~5 $ 16,832.50 Sixteen Thousand Eight

Hundred Thirty-two and 50/100 Dollars

23



Special Notes:

Should the Contractor plan to use any subcontractors for the work, list as appropriate below
and provide telephone numbers.

N/A

Contractor is to provide at least three (3) references (Names and Telephone Numbers)

Chris Scanlon (Pace Construction) 314-565-1583
Name Phone Number

Cecilia Cain (Apex Paving Company) 573-331-7561
Name Phone Number

Chuck Risley (Gershenson Construction) 636-549-0202
Name Phone Number

24



The Undersigned understands and agrees the quantities shown herein are estimated, that
payment shall be made on a unit cost basis.

The Undersigned understands and agrees that the City of Amold may, at its discretion,
elect to add and/or delete quantities, at any time during the contract period.

The Undersigned understands that items incidental to the project including but not limited to
mobilization, testing/certification, cleaning and sweeping, traffic control, and final cleanup
are included in the above unit costs as well as any other miscellaneous work as required to
provide a complete work product.

Suitable bid security in the amount of Sixteen Thousand Eight Hundred Thirty-two & 50/100 Dollars
($_16,832.50 ) as called for in the Advertisement of Bids accompanies this
Bid. This sum is to be forfeited to the City of Arnold if the party, or parties, making this Bid
fail to enter into contract with approved securities within ten (10) days after the award of the
Contract has been made.

The undersigned has examined the Plans and Specifications and the location of the project
and has satisfied self as to the work to be done and the conditions under which it must be
carried out,

NAME OF BUSINESS

(If an individual)
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If Co-partnership)
FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If a Corporation)
CORPORATE NAME

SIGNATURE W(A;W . /LZ;W

BUSINESS ADDRESS 3051 Mercantile Industrial Drive, St. Charles MO 63301

TraMar Contracting, Inc.

TELEPHONE NO. (636) 255-0808

25



STATE OF MISSOURI )

COUNTY OF _St. Charles )

OSHA AFFIDAVIT
Before me, the undersigned Notary Public, personally came and appeared Margaret M. McG rath
(NAME-PRINTED)
President of TraMar Contracting, Inc. 5
(POSITION) (NAME OF COMPANY)

(a corporation) (a partnership) (a proprietorship) and, after being duly sworn, did depose and say that
all provisions and requirements set out in Section 292.675, Missouri Revised Statutes, pertaining to
the 10-hour OSHA construction safety training of workmen employed on public works projects have
been fully satisfied and there has been no exception to the full and complete compliance with said
provisions and requirements. The referenced OSHA training is necessary in carrying out the contract
and work in connection with OLD LEMAY FERRY ROAD-STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING
PROJECT at the City of Arnold in Jefferson County, Missouri. Said training of all project workmen
has been or will be undertaken within 60 days of commencement of construction of the project. The

Contractor is to provide to the City copies of OSHA certifications cards of each project workman.

(SIGNATURE)

Y
Subscribed and sworn to before me this Lﬁ day of m Al H ,2017]

2

otary Public

My commission expires on: A‘-{; § lete

A\ 3

CHARLES F. TERRID
Notary Public - Notary Seal
tate of Missouri
Commissianed for St. Charies Cou
My Commission Expires: August 05, 2020
_Commission Number: 12614248

15



STATE OF MISSOURI g
ss
COUNTY OF St. Charles )

AFFIDAVIT OF AMERICAN PRODUCTS PURCHASE

Comes now before me Margaret M. McGrath _ as President of TraMar Contracting, Inc,
(NAME) (OFFICE HELD) (COMPANY NAME)

being duly sworn on his/her oath, affirms that said company has complied with Missouri State
Law Section 34-353 RSMo regarding the purchase of manufactured good or commodities used
or supplied in the performance of the City of Arnold’s OLD LEMAY FERRY ROAD -
STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT.

1 also affirm that _TraMar Contracting, Inc. did not and would not knowingly
(COMPANY NAME)

purchase or supply manufactured goods or commodities used on the aforementioned City of
Arnold project, being compliant with the law. In affirmation thereof, the facts stated above are
true and correct (the undersigned understands that faise statements made in this filing are subject

to penalties provided under Section 575.040 RSMo).

Margaret M. McGrath

ON WITH AUTHORITY)

{PRINTED NAME)
President Z/z 9/249/ 7
(TITLE) (DATE)
Subscribed and sworn to before me this 284 day of _J{l A2 tif 017

(I 0
Notary Public

My commission expires S 2o

Nota PuhthNTotary gea]

tate of Missol
Cummlssloned for 8t Chl;rrifes Cou
ion Expnres August 05, 2020
lon Number: 12614248

17



NON COLLUSION FORM

Margaret M. McGrath being duly sworn in oath deposed and states:

i

1L

That in connection with this procurement,

a. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently, without consultation,
communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting competition as to any matter
relating to such prices with any other bidder or with any competitor;

b. The prices which have been quoted in this bid have not been knowingly disclosed by the
bidder and will not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to opening directly or
indirectly to any other bidder; or to any competitor; and,

¢. No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person or
firm to submit or not to submit a bid for the purpose of restricting competition.

The undersigned further states:

a. He is the person in the bidders’ organization responsible within that organization for the
decision as to the prices being bid herein and that he has not participated, and will not
participate, in any action contrary to (D) (a) through (I) (c) above.

b. He is not the person in the bidder’s organization responsible within that organization for
the decision as to the prices being bed herein but that he has been authorized in writing to
act as agent for the persons responsible for such decision in certifying that such persons

have not participated, and will not participate, in any action contrary to (I) (a) through (1)
(c) above, and as their agent does hereby so certify; and he has not participated, and will

not participate in any action conirary to (1) (a) through (I) (c) above.

IlI. The Contractor hereby attests to their intent to compty with the American with Disabilities Act.

(ADA).

IV. Itis expressly understood that the foregoing statements, representations, and promises are made

as a condition to the right of the bidder to receive payment under any award made hereunder.

For Corporations

m———————
PARTNERSHIP OR SOLE PROPRIETOR)

(Corporate Seal)
President
(OFFICE HELD IN BIDDER
ORGANIZATION)
ATTEST:
By
Subscribed and sworn to before me this 2 nday of _ 20] 7/
p. /g J
Notary Publfc
My commission expires on: pub ‘5/, 2020 GHARLES F. ‘!’EFIF'tIDeal
! Public - Notary
mg!m of Misgenm
Commissianed for St. ?khad385 o
Cominission Explres: August Ua,
W - Wber. 12614248

19



Affidavit of Work Authorization

Comes now _Margaret M. McGrath (name) as _President (office held)

first being duly sworn, on my oath, affirm _TraMar Contracting, Inc. {(company hame)

is enrolled and will continue to participate in a federal work authorization program in respect to
employees that will work in connection with the contracted services related to "OLD LEMAY
FERRY ROAD-STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT” for the duration of the
contract, if awarded in accordance with RSMo Chapter 285.530(2). | also affirm that

TraMar Contracting, Inc. (company name) does not and will not knowingly employ a

person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the contracted services related to OLD
LEMAY FERRY ROAD-STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT for the duration of the

contract, if awarded.

In Affirmation thereof, the facts stated above are true and correct (The
undersigned understands that false statements made in this filing are subject to
the penalties provided under Section 575.040, RSMo).

/Lk/ /{/M Margaret M. McGrath
Signatu £ Printed Name

President 3/2 f/Zf’/?
Title Date
Subscribed and sworn before me the 22“‘ day of MMLH . lam

commissioned as a notary public within the county of S‘I'-C(\cu fa

State of _lyssou (. and my commission expires on Awa S' A2

3/28 /17

Signature of notary - Date

oty bl '5535‘ Seal

tate of Wissouri
Commigsioned for St. Charles
Ny CormniBsion Bxpites: Augu

st 05,
sjon Nurper 12614248 |
20




Hold Harmless Agreement

To the fullest extent permitted by law, _TraMar Contracting, Inc. S
hereafter referred to as Contractor, agrees to indemnify, defend and hold harmiess the
City of Arnold, its officers, agents, volunteers, invitees, lessees and employees from and
against any and all suits, claims, damages losses and expenses, including but not
limited to attorneys’ fees, court costs or alternative dispute resolution costs arising out of
or related to any such suit, claim, damage, loss or expense involving an injury to a
person or persons, whether bodily injury or other personal injury (including death), or
involving an injury or damage to property (including loss of use or diminution in value),
but only to the extent that such suits, claims, damages, losses or expenses were
caused by the negligence or other wrongdoing of Contractor, or of any supplier or
subcontractor, or their agents or employees, directly or indirectly, regardless of whether
caused in part by the negligence or wrongdoing of CITY or any of its agents or
employees.

Pursuant to the requirements of the bid and contract for OLD LEMAY FERRY ROAD-
STREET SECTION RE-STRIPING PROJECT, Contractor shall purchase and maintain
the following insurance, at Contractor's expense:

» Commercial General Liability Insurance with a minimum limit of $1,000,000 each
occurrence/$2,000,000 general aggregate written on an occurrence basis. If
Contractor maintains higher limits than the minimums required, the CITY requires
and shall be entitled to coverage for the higher limits maintained by Contractor.

« Workers Compensation Insurance with statutorily limits required by any
applicable Federal or State law and Employers Liability insurance with minimum
limit of $1,000,000 per accident.

Contractor shall make CITY an additional insured on each policy of insurance that
Contractor is required to maintain. Similarly, Contractor shall require insurance with the
same coverage and limits from its subcontractors and suppliers, and their insurance
policies shall be endorsed to name the same additional insureds as required of
Contractor. Any coverage available to CITY as a named insured shall be secondary, so
that the coverage to the CITY as an additional insured on the policies maintained by
Contractor and Contractor's subcontractors is primary and non-contributory. CITY
reserves the right to selectively trigger any one or more insurance policies that afford
CITY coverage, whether as a named insured or as an additional insured. Contractor
agrees that CITY shall be provided at least thirty (30) days advance written notice of
any cancellation or rescission of any policy that Contractor or any of its subcontractors
or suppliers is required to maintain under the contract documents. Prior to commencing
work, Contractor shall provide CITY certificates of insurance and endorsements
evidencing the required coverage. CITY's receipt or review of any certificate of
insurance reflecting that Contractor or one of its subcontractors or suppliers has failed
or may have failed to comply with any insurance requirement shall not constitute a
waiver of any of CITY’s insurance rights under the contract documents, with all such
rights being fully and completely reserved by the CITY.

21



No provision of this agreement shall constitute a waiver of the CITY’s right to assert a
defense based on the doctrines of sovereigh immunity, official immunity or any other
immunity available under law.

CONTRAWOR

3/24/ z0/1

DATE

22



CITY OF ARNOLD CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL

FROM: MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR
SUBJECT: CODE ENFORCEMENT GRASS CUTTING BID

DATE: MARCH 24, 2017

@ e

The City placed a bid for code enforcement grass cutting and we received one tesponse from the
company currently doing our code enforcement grass cutting, Action Landscape. Staff is
recommending we go with Action Landscape since we have worked with them for the past few
years and they were the only one to bid.

Below is additional information from Jeff Preis of the Health Department regarding the bid.

Recently we out for bid for code enforcement grass cutting services for the 2017-2018
seasons. We added a few additional requirements for pricing to get a better feel on what
companies are charging for code enforcement properties.

Action Landscaping was the only bid received out of ten that were mailed out [in
addition to advertising]. We have used this company for the past two years with only a few
problems. Since we only received one bid, I would like to recommend going with Action
Landscaping for the 2017-2018 season. Attached is a copy of the bid received from this
company.

Respectfully,

Jeff Preis

Staff recommends we award the contract to Action Landscaping since we have been working
with them for the last two years and they provided the only bid.



RESOLUTION NO. 17-13

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO AN
AGREEMENT WITH ACTION LANDSCAPING FOR CODE
ENFORCEMENT GRASS CUTTIING SERVICES FOR 2017-2018 SEASON

BE IT RESOLVED. By the Council of the City of Arnold, Missouri that the Community
Development Department, is hereby authorized to accept the grass cutting bid from Action
Landscaping for code enforcement grass cutting services for the 201-2018 season.

A copy of said bid is attached hereto and made a part hereof reference.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk Tammi Casey

Date:

ZMNCITYDOCS\RESOLUTNM 7-13 Grass cutting bid.doc
March 24, 2017



Action e
Imperial, MO 63052

Landscaping Phone 636.296.7469
-Est. 1981- Fax 636.287.8833
2/28/2017

SPRING / SUMMER SEASON 2013
LAWN PROPOSAL SUBMITTED TO:

City of Arnold Health Dept.
2912 Arnold Tenbrook Rd.
Arnold, Mo 63010
Attn: Jeff Preis 636-282-2387

Action Landscaping, Inc. proposes to furnish materials, (abor, and equipment necessary for
lawn service for the coming season for the property above as follows:

Grass cutting for city weed control ordinance for 2017 and 2018. Pricing as follows:

8" 14" 18" 24"
Small property 0-5,000 sq. ft. $30 $40 $50 $65
Medium property 5,000 to 8,000 sq. ft. $35 $45 $60 $75
Large property 8,000 to 10,000 sq. ft. $40 $50 $70 $85
Property of one acre $50 $65 $90 $105
Property exceeding one acre $65 $80 $100 $115

** Over 24" call for pricing---1-Laborer and weed eater $40 per hour
** Price to move debris is $100 per hour for crew of 3 for hand carryable items only.
** Track maching and brush hog $95/ per hour for heavy items or super tall grass.
Action Landscaping, Inc. has all necessary insurance and maintains City of Arnold Business License.
Business References:
Anheuser Busch-Inbev Metal Container Corp. 30 years
Browning Arms on Tenbrook Rd.
Public Water Supply District #1 -

PAYMENT TERMS  Lawn service accounts are billed monthly with terms of net 30 from date of service for all
open "accounts”. A service charge of 1.5% will be charged for all past due accounts. All material is guaranteed to
be as specified. All work to be completed in a workmanlike manner according to standard practices. Any alteration
or deviation from above specifications involving extra costs will become an extra charge over & above the estimate.
All agreements contingent upon strikes, accidents, or delays beyond our control; such as extreme weather . We are
as careful as possible.. Action Landscaping, Inc. carries liability and workman's compensation insurance on all
employees. We are also licensed by the State Department of Agriculture.

ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL  Action Landscaping, Inc. is hereby authorized to furnish all material, equipment,
and labor necessary to complete the work described above, for which the undersigned is a lawful representative of
the company for which the work is being done. This proposal expires 30 days from origination.

Signature Date



The City of

Arnold....

Date: March 30, 2017

To: Mayor and City Council

From: David Crutchley, Parks Superintendent
Subject: Arnold Recreation Center HVYAC Replacement

The City placed a request for bids for the replacement of the Arnold Recreation Center HVAC
system.

The budget for this project for this fiscal year is $300,000.

Three companies submitted completed bids as follows:

#1 - Peters-Eichler Mechanical Incorporated - $299,000

#2 - Sheet Metal Contractors Incorporated (SMCI) - $314,270

#3 - Haberberger Mechanical (varied bids) — between $306,240 and $344,240

All companies are more than capable of completing the bid request. In consideration of the

budget, | would like to recommend Peters-Eichler Mechanical Incorporated with a submitted bid
of $299,000.



RESOLUTION NO. 17-14

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ENTER INTO A
CONTRACT WITH PETERS-EICHLER MECHANICAL TO
PROVIDE AN HVAC SYSTEM FOR THE ARNOLD RECREATION
CENTER

BE IT RESOLVED by the Council of the City of Arnold, Missouri, that the Mayor
be, and is hereby authorized to enter into a contract with Peters-Eichler
Mechanical Inc., Inc. to provide an HVAC replacement system for the Arnold
Recreation Center.

A copy of said contract is attached hereto and made a part hereof reference.

Presiding Officer of the City Council

Mayor Ron Counts
ATTEST:

City Clerk, Tammi Casey

Date:

ZACITYDOCS\RESOLUTN\17-14 HVAC Contract Peters Eichler Mech. 2017.doc
April 6,2017



HVAC Replacement - RecCtr
Bid opening: March 28, 2017 10:00 a.m.
Dave Crutchley; Tammi Casey; Deb Lewis

10

3 bids received

Contractor Location Option Price

Peters-Eichler Mechanical St Louis, MO 299,000.00
SMCI Desoto, MO 314,270.00
Haberberger Mechanical Affton, MO 4 ynits at 1 time 306,240.00
Haberberger Mechanical Affton, MO 2 units at a time 314,240.00
Haberberger Mechanical Affton, MO 1 unit at a time 344,240.00




EXHIBIT A
BID FORM
HVAC REPLACEMENT FOR ARNOLD RECREATION CENTER

Please fill out this cost response form so that the City may accurately compare different
bids without having to interpret vendor's cost presentations. |f desired, attach additional

cost data, including itemizations.

Company Name: __ Peters-Eichler Mechanical, Inc.

Date: March 28, 2017

City of Arnold
2101 Jeffco Boulevard
Arnold, Missouri 63010

Mayor and City Council Members:

In accordance with the advertisement inviting Bids for HVAC Replacement for Arnold
Recreation Center to the City of Arnold, subject to the conditions and requirements of

the Contract and the Product Specifi catlons including Addenda Nos.. o,
and , hereto attached, which so far as they relate to the Bid, are made a part of

it, the underslgned herewith proposes to begin the specified work within ten (10) days
after receipt of notice to proceed, for the following unit prices:

HVAC Replacement for Arnold Recreation Center as described above in
specifications in this bid (Trane Manufacturer). .

s 299,000
AJA H32562 ft{ffar Po\.f_}'j wwm"ﬁy

Name of Equal Manufacturer

N/A $ N/A

SIGNATURES ON NEXT PAGE



The Undersigned understands and agrees that the City of Arnold may, at its discretion,
elect to delete areas, prior to the notice to proceed.

The Undersigned understands that items incidental to the project including but not
limited to any final cleanup and disposals are included in the above costs.

The undersigned has examined the Specifications for, and the location of, the project
and has satisfied himself as to the work to be done and the conditions under which it

must be carried out,

NAME OF BUSINESS Peters-Eichler Mechanical, Inc.

(If an Individual)
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If Co-Partnership)
FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(if a Corporation)

CORPORATE NAME PeteQrS—EichIer Mechanical, Inc.

SIGNATURE —_ Mf/& < s
—

BUSINESS ADDRESS 3115 Sutton Boulevard St. Louis, MO 63143

TELEPHONE NO. (314) 647-4023




EXHIBIT A.

BID FORM

HVAC REPLACEMENT FOR ARNOLD RECREATION CENTER
Please fill out this cost response form so that the City may accurately compare different
bids without having to interpret vendor's cost presentations. If desired, attach additional
cost data, including itemizations.

Company Name: Haberberger Mechanical

Date: 3-28-17

City of Arnold
2101 Jeffco Boulevard
Arnold, Missouri 63010

Mayor and City Council Members:

In accordance with the advertisement inviting Bids for HYAC Replacement for Arnold
Recreation Center to the City of Arnold, subject to the conditions and requirements of
the Contract and the Product Specifications including Addenda Nos.  N/A |, ,
and , hereto attached, which so far as they relate to the Bid, are made a part of
it, the undersigned herewith proposes to begin the specified work within ten (10) days
after receipt of notice to proceed, for the following unit prices:

HVAC Replacement for Arnold Recreation Center as described above in
specifications in this bid (Trane Manufacturer).

Option #1: 1 Crane Hoist (4 units at one time) $_306,240
Option #2: 2 Crane Hoist (2 units at a time) $_314,240
Option #3: 4 Crane Hoist (1 unit at a time) $_344.240

e Please note that pricing are not to be construed as divisible.
¢ Completion date will to be based on equipment delivery.

SIGNATURES ON NEXT PAGE



The Undersigned understands and agrees that the City of Arnold may, at its discretion,
~ elect to delete areas, prior to the notice to proceed.

The Undersigned understands that items incidental to the project including but not
limited to any final cleanup and disposals are included in the above costs.

The undersigned has examined the Specifications for, and the location of, the project
and has satisfied himself as to the work to be done and the conditions under which it

must be carried out.

NAME OF BUSINESS H s ber }De,r'qw mac_,lqﬁ—n,,' cA.]

(If an Individual)
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(if Co-Partnership)
FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If a Corporation)
CORPORATE NAME HAbubarqe,r7 ive. Mecharical ConTrpetors

'z

SIGNATURE

BUSINESS ADDRESS 77 4y 09/-}:4 Ljwe. Plﬁlce., ﬁfffw,mo 6313
TELEPHONE NO. 314 (L31-332 4




BID BOND

Conforms with The American Institute of
Architects, A.l.A. Document No. A-310

KINOW ALL BY THESE PRESENTS, That we, Haberberger, Inc.

97 44 Pauline Place, St. Louis, MO 63123

5 - .
S Principal, hereinafier called the Principal

and the Western Surety Company

of _530 Maryville Center Drive, Suite #310, St. Louis, MO 63141

» & corporation duly organized under
the laws of the State of South Dakota » as Surety, hereinafter called th ¢ Surety, are held and
A eld an

firmly bound unto

City of Arnold
2101 Jeffco Bivd., Arnold, MO 683010

in the sum of Ten Percent of Bid Amount ----- - -« - ___________________ -

Dollars ($_10% of Bid Amount ), for the payment of which sum well and truly to, o i s s o
Surety, bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors and assigns, jointly and © the said Principal and the said

SeVerally, firmly by these presents,

WHEREAS, the Principal has submitted a bid for Arnold Recreation Center HVAC Replac:er.nent

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee shall accept the bid of the Principal and the Principal shalj enter it -

in accordance with the terms of such bid, and give such bond or bonds as may be specified in the biddin o4 (éontract with the Obligee
good and sufficient surety for the faithful performance of such Contract and for the prompt Paymen 01ngor ontract [?ocumefits with
the prosecution thereof, or in the event of the failure of the Principal to enter such Contracy aiid iva or and material furnished in
Principal shall pay to the Obligee the difference not to exceed the penalty hereof between the o uft Se su'}:‘h bgnd ?r bfmds, if the
larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith contract with another party to perform the Work pecitied in Sa_ld b}d and such
obligation shall be null and void, otherwise to remain in full force and effect. Ori covered by said bid, then this

Signed and sealed this 28th day of March

2017

b

Haberberger, Inc.

V4 Witness

(Seal)
Principal

&:\ W Hestern Surety Compan
Witness { By '
Brandi Bullock

Attorney-in-Fact

S-0054/GEEF 12/00



NON COLLUSION FORM

7 P
/‘//’/é"/@/ being duly sworn in oath deposed and states:
[

r=

I. Thatin connection with this procurement,

a. The prices in this bid have been arrived at independently, without consultation,
communication, or agreement, for the purpose of restricting competition as to any matter
relating to such prices with any other bidder or with any competitor;

b. The prices which have been quoted in this bid have not been knowingly disclosed by the
bidder and will not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to opening directly or
indirectly to any other bidder; or to any competitor; and,

c. No attempt has been made or will be made by the bidder to induce any other person or
firm to submit or not to submit a bid for the purpose of restricting competition.

II.  The undersigned further states:

a. He is the person in the bidders’ organization responsible within that organization for the
decision as to the prices being bid herein and that he has not participated, and will not
participate, in any action contrary to (I) (a) through (I) (c) above.

b. He is not the person in the bidder’s organization responsible within that organization for
the decision as to the prices being bed herein but that he has been authorized in writing to
act as agent for the persons responsible for such decision in certifying that such persons
have not participated, and will not participate, in any action contrary to (I) (a) through (I)
(c) above, and as their agent does hereby so certify; and he has not participated, and will
not participate in any action contrary to (I) (a) through (I) (c) above.

II. The Contractor hereby attests to their intent to comply with the American with Disabilities Act.
(ADA).

IV. It is expressly understood that the foregoing statements, representations, and promises are made
as a condition to the right of the bidder to receive payment under any, #ward made hereunder.

; //

PART:NERSHIP OR SOLE PROPRIETOR)

(Corporate Seal)
ké/ Ju,fuc ,
FFICE HELD IN B{DDER
ORGANIZATION% {%ﬁ,ﬁmﬁf ? §

ATTES
Subscribed and swormn to before me th1 8’ dam\, Lﬂ 0 }7

)
My commission expires oj%ﬂbﬁuj \é;;
”

For Corporations

? MM"E”M{SA‘ MAWMB\IM
JANYCE 1 . BUEHRLE ;
’\!oury PL'bhc - Notary Seaj ‘
State of Missouri, St Lous Co l

l\, CComrnmaon 14437813 ;
y omrmss 2
My ¢ mn Ehrlres Feb 9, 2018 f

R e P

19 ey

unty



Affidavit of Work Authorization
Comes now _md/t [é«b’dﬂ/é t'fbj’ﬂi (name) as éﬂfﬂ %/ (office
held) first being duly sworn, on my oath, affirm AA&ZMZ%«;&&_ . ~«Z_~(company

name) is enrolled and will continue to barticipate in a federal work authorization program
in respect to employees that will work in connection with the contracted services related
to THE ARNOLD RECREATION CENTER HVAC REPLACEMENT PROJECT for the
duration of the contract, if awarded in accordance with RSMo Chapter 285.530 (2). |
also affirm that _HAM#Q_LMWW\DEHY name) does not and will not
knowingly employ a person who is an unauthorized alien in connection with the
contracted services related to THE ARNOLD RECREATION CENTER HVAC

REPLACEMENT PROJECT for the duration of the contract, if awarded.

In Affirmation thereof, the facts stated above are true and correct (The
undersigned understands that false statements made in this filing are subject
to the penalties provided under Section 575.040, RSMo).

Marl Ha bevberser

Printed Name

/

1gnature

e

Cocere vy 2 / 7% / =
Title ~ Date

Subscribed and sworn before me the& Wday ofyﬂw ; CQO/ 7 Iam

commissioned as a notary public within the county of L ,%‘7,{ ey . State
5 Z 1 F i

< -~
ra) -
(W / QA and my commission expires on

%(}/% :;Z,{)[éz.

i "'ﬁ‘.%*&gﬁ'}mﬂ-ﬁx\hﬁr 0

JANYGE K. BUCHSELE 5

3 Motary Public - Notziv Seal |

g State of Missouri, St Louis County

j Cominission 4 14437813

{ My Comimission Expires Feb 9, 2018
e

Rl - e R ey

BT
K EG



Hold Harmless Agreement

To the fullest extent permitted by law, H f bo,r be/r Soy }A/ Lo )
hereafter referred to as Contractor, agrees to indemnify, defend and hold harmless
the City of Amold, its officers, agents, volunteers, invitees, lessees and employees
from and against any and all suits, claims, damages losses and expenses, including
but not limited to attorneys’ fees, court costs or alternative dispute resolution costs
arising out of or related to any such suit, claim, damage, loss or expense involving
an injury to a person or persons, whether bodily injury or other personal injury
(including death), or involving an injury or damage to property (including loss of use
or diminution in value), but only to the extent that such suits, claims, damages,
losses or expenses were caused by the negligence or other wrongdoing of
Contractor, or of any supplier or subcontractor, or their agents or employees, directly
or indirectly, regardless of whether caused in part by the negligence or wrongdoing
of CITY or any of its agents or employees,

Pursuant to the requirements of the bid and contract for HVAG Replacement
Project, Contractor shall purchase and maintain the following insurance, at
Contractor’s expense:

* Commercial General Liability Insurance with a minimum limit of $1,000,000
each occurrence/$2,000,000 general aggregate written on an occurrence
basis. If Contractor maintains higher limits than the minimums required, the
CITY requires and shall be entitled to coverage for the higher limits
maintained by Contractor.

* Workers Compensation Insurance with statutorily limits required by any
applicable Federal or State law and Employers Liability insurance with
minimum limit of $1,000,000 per accident.

Contractor shall make CITY an additional insured on each policy of insurance that
Contractor is required to maintain. Similarly, Contractor shall require insurance with
the same coverage and limits from its subcontractors and suppliers, and their
insurance policies shall be endorsed to name the same additional insureds as
required of Contractor. Any coverage available to CITY as a named insured shall be
secondary, so that the coverage to the CITY as an additional insured on the policies
maintained by Contractor and Contractor's subcontractors is primary and non-
contributory. CITY reserves the right to selectively trigger any one or more
insurance policies that afford CITY coverage, whether as a named insured or as an
additional insured. Contractor agrees that CITY shall be provided at least thirty (30)
days advance written notice of any cancellation or rescission of any policy that
Contractor or any of its subcontractors or suppliers is required to maintain under the
contract documents. Prior to commencing work, Contractor shall provide CITY

33



certificates of insurance and endorsements evidencing the required coverage.
CITY’s receipt or review of any certificate of insurance reflecting that Contractor or
one of its subcontractors or suppliers has failed or may have failed to comply with
any insurance requirement shall not constitute a waiver of any of CITY’s insurance
rights under the contract documents, with all such rights being fully and completely
reserved by the CITY,

No provision of this agreement shall constitute a waiver of the CITY’s right to assert
a defense based on the doctrines of sovereign immunity, official immunity or any
other immunity available under law.

D Ao —

CONTRACTOR

>/ 20 Jz07>

DATE

34



STATE OF MISSOURI )
) ss
COUNTY OF )

AFFIDAVIT OF AMERICAN PRODUCTS PURCHASE

Comes now before mez{ég é é,& R Ioh /RS L‘W See,  of Ag, Cpfp et ge
(NAME) (OFFICE HELD) (COMPANY NAME

being duly sworn on his/her oath, affirms that said company has complied with Missouri State

Law Section 34-353 RSMo regarding the purchase of manufactured good or commodities used
or supplied in the performance of the City of Arnold’s ARNOLD RECREATION HVAC

REPLACEMENT PROJECT .

I also affirm that ,44&/5 e ts 164'5’/‘5"’ g Lo (company name) did not and would
not knowingly purchase or supply manufactured goods or commodities used on the aforementioned
City of Amold project, being compliant with the law. In affirmation thereof, the facts stated above
are true and correct (the undersigned understands that false statements made in this filing are subject

to penalties provided under Section 575.040 RSMo).

Z ( AR/ 2 l% e
[GNATURE (PERSON WITH AUTZIORITY) (PRINTED NAME)

[ZM% 511&, %/95%’7

(TITLE) (DATE) 7

Subscribed and sworn to before me thls?lg\{dyay of(/*)/ }/& (,/é ,20 / 7

mu/\m ;g//gm M
Notary Public
Y é,l/c(@ /a”
My commission expires on: ]
LR R T T S T S G X
g JANYGE K. BUEHRLE )
A Notary Public - Notary Seal :

) State of Miissourl, 5t Louis County :
] Commisgion 5% 14437813 /
Y My Commission Expires Feb 9, 2018 .

Hia e

24



EXHIBIT A
BID FORM
HVAC REPLACEMENT FOR ARNOLD RECREATION CENTER
Please fill out this cost response form so that the City may accurately compare different
bids without having to interpret vendor's cost presentations. If desired, attach additional

cost data, including itemizations.

Company Name: _ Sheet Metal Contractors, Inc.

Date: March 28, 2017

City of Arnold
2101 Jeffco Boulevard
Arnold, Missouri 63010

Mayor and City Council Members:

In accordance with the advertisement inviting Bids for HVAC Replacement for Arold
Recreation Center to the City of Arnold, subject to the conditions and requirements of

the Contract and the Product Specnﬂcanons including Addenda Nos. None
and , hereto attached, which so far as they relate to the Bid, are made a part of

it, the under8|gned herewith proposes to begin the specified work W|th|n ten (10) days
after receipt of notice to proceed, for the following unit prices:

HVAC Replacement for Arnold Recreation Center as described above in
specifications in this bid (Trane Manufacturer).

s 3/ 270"

Name of Equal Manufacturer

N/A : $

SIGNATURES ON NEXT PAGE



The Undersigned understands and agrees that the City of Arnold may, at its discretion,
elect to delete areas, prior to the notice to proceed.

The Undersigned understands that items incidental to the project including but not -
limited to any final cleanup and disposals are included in the above costs.

The undersigned has examined the Specifications for, and the location of, the project

and has satisfied himself as to the work to be done and the conditions under which it
must be carried out.

NAME OF BUSINESS Sheet Metal Contractors, Inc.

(If an Individual)
SIGNATURE OF BIDDER

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If Co-Partnership) .
FIRM NAME

SIGNATURE

BUSINESS ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO.

(If a Corporation)
CORPORATE NAME Sheet Metal Contractors, Ine

SIGNATURE =Y.~ ML@M e .

BUSINESS ADDRESS 1661 Veterarfs Drive, PO Box 700, DeSoto, MO 63020

TELEPHONE NO. 636.337.2150




- Ml

EXCELLENCE PREVAILS - Since 1580

March 24, 2017

ARNOLD RECREATION
HVAC REPLACEMENT

BID CLARIFICATIONS
BID DATE 3/28/17

1. 5-Year compressor only warranty is included per rooftop and MUA unit spec.
There is no labor allowance after first year.

2. The RTU’s and MUA will ship approximately 10 weeks afer approval of shop
drawings by owner. We will complete work in the 60 days allotted from the
time the units arrive on the job site.

3. Certified Air Balancing is NOT included.

4. We will reclaim Freon and put into owners tanks.

5. Trane has included commissioning of systems and it is included in our bid.

PO Box 700 | 1661 Veterans Drive - De Soto, MO 63020 | Phone: (636) 337-2150 | Fax: (636) 337-6074 | www.smcihvac.com



8.A

CITY OF ARNOLD CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO:
FROM:

SUBJECT:

DATE:
CC:

THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR

2017-01, CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT FOR S & ] SNOW CONE
STAND, AT TENBROOK PLAZA, 776 JEFFCO BLVD. (CORNER OF
JEFFCO AND TENBROOK) PLANNING COMMISSION
RECOMMENDATION

MARCH 28, 2017

Request

Mt. Joseph X Sorg, Jr is requesting permission to open a snow cone stand at 776 Jeffco
Blvd located in Tenbrook Plaza at Jeffco Blvd and Tenbrook Road from mid-March until
eatly September. Attached is the application, site plan of location, aerial of the site, and
written information regarding the use.

Summary

The Planning Commission held a public hearing and considered this request at their
March 14, 2017 meeting. No one spoke at the public hearing and minimal discussion during
the regular meeting. The Commission voted 8-0 to forward a recommendation of approval
with the below findings and conditions:

Findings:

1.

2

The use can be opetated in a manner that is not detrimental to the permitted
developments and uses in the district.

The use can be developed and operated in a manner that is visually
compatible with the permitted uses in the surrounding area.

Condition:

1.

3.

Building permits required for the placement of the stand, electric, etc.

Jefferson County Health Department permit required.

All structures, tables, trash containers, etc. must be located at least fifty feet from

the front propetty line.
The tables, trash containers, etc. may not create an obstruction for vehicle traffic.



5. A written agreement is provided to the City regarding the use of restrooms for
the employees of the snow cone stand.
6. The conditional use permit is good for two yeats and will expire on the last day

of October 3, 2016.
7. The atea is kept clean of trash and debris that may result from the snow cone

stand.
8. The hours of operation are from 1:00 p.m. to 10:00 p.m.
9. 'The trailer is removed on or before October 1, 2017 and 2018.
10. The operation may open March 1 of each year of the conditional use permit.
11. All necessary permits are issued in conjunction with opening the snow cone

stand.
Analysis

This request is similar to the previous snow cone stand request for this location and
other stands in the City. The proposed location of this snow cone stand is the exact location
as the one previously approved for this site. There were no issues in the past and Staff does
not anticipate issues with this request.

The conditional use will be good until October 1, 2018. 'This will allow time for the
application to close the stand and remove from the property. The proposed hours of
operation are seven days a week, 1:00 pm to 10:00 pm.

When reviewing a conditional use petmit, the following must be taken into
consideration:

The use is deemed consistent with good planning practice.

The use can be operated in a manner that is not detrimental to the permitted
developments and uses in the district.

The use can be developed and operated in a manner that is visually compatible
with the permitted uses in the surrounding area.

The use is deemed essential or desirable to preserve and promote the public
health, safety, and general welfare of the City of Arnold.



[ e btk >

vafﬂby

Community Development Department

City of Arnold
2101 Jeffeo Bhd.
Amoeld, MO 63010
6362822378
636-282-6677 Fax
CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT
APPI.ICATION

File Number 53‘0‘ \1-0)\ : $400.00 Fee Paid
APPLICANT/CONTRACT PURCHASER OWNER:

S&J Sno-B tar Sho Inc TenbrOOk, LC =
Name Joseph X Sorb Jr. Name

5249 Liberty School Road PO Box 528, St. MO 63073
Address, City, State, Zip Hillsboro, MO 63050 Address, City, State, Zip

314-960-3048 636-458-0545 _
Telephone Number Telephone Number

636-458-7650

Facsimile Number Facsimile Number

Site plan attached

‘Jeffco Blvd. & Tenbrook | £-2, Commercial
Property Address {or nearest intersection) Lemng of pmpenv
_E-m%m Sno-Cone Stan__@ﬁ
Adjacent Zoning/Uses
Whﬂ South East West

02/07/2017

Date of application

Signature of Aﬁ-ﬁlicant




4

= 2RIl (25 o2 & o frio £ 2plio i) R i BT <) SR BT

100 Feaet




EXHIBIT A

Site Plan

3

e
1 1 %1
i
.

1
SRR ..

oo%.mﬂu.-.s .

18



PROPOSED SPOT FOR S&J SNO-BALL

CUSTARD SHOP INC.

WALGREENS PARKING LOT AT 776 JEFFCO BLVD ARNOLD
MO. TENBROOK PLAZA.

AT THE CORNER OF TENBROOK RD AND JEFFCO

OWNERS OF PROPERTY
JONES REALTY

531 HAWK POINT DR POBOX 528 ST.ALBANS MO 63073
636 458-0545 FAX 636 451-6392

NEAR BY BUSINESS'S
WALGREENS

FOX C-6

NAPA AUTO PARTS
SALVATION ARMY

UMB ATM

METRO BUSINESS COLLEGE
ORLANDO FAMILY PRODUCE



PROPOSED BUSINESS

FAMILY OWNED BUSINESS SINCE 1989. S&J
SNO-BALL CUSTARD SHOP INC. THIS
LOCATION WOULD BE USED FOR SNOWCONE
RETAIL

BUSINESS

OWNER OF BUSINESS

JOSEPH X SORG JR

314 960-3048

SNJ2091(@GMAIL.COM

5249 LIBERTY SCHOOL ROAD

HILLSBORO MO 63050

WE HAVE 3 OTHER LOCATIONS. ARNOLD
(CUSTARD SHOP) OPEN ALL YEAR. 2 MOBILE
UNITS IN HIGH RIDGE. OPEN ONLY DURING
SUMMER

HOURS OF OPERATION

OPEN MID MARCH. CLOSE EARLY SEPT. OPEN
7 DAYS A WEEK 1PM TO 10PM



MOBILE UNIT (TRAILER)
TRAILER INFO

TRAILOR SIZE. 7 FOOT WIDE. 15 FEET LONG.

TO SECURE TRAILER. WE WILL HAVE 4 MOBILE HOME STAKES
UNDER TRAILER AND WILL ALSO HAVE BLOCKS UNDER THE
WHEELS.

FOR OUR CUSTOMERS WE HAVE 4 LIGHTS. 2 IN THE REAR OF
BUILDING AND 2 IN FRONT OF BUILDING.

WATER & GREY WATER

FOR CLEANING WE WILL BE USING LARGE CONTAINERS OF
WATER FROM SAMS. WE HAVE A WATER STORAGE
CONTAINER IN TRAILER WITH A HOT WATER HEATER AND A
PUMP THAT FEEDS OUR HAND WASHING SINK AND OUR 3
COMPARTMENT SINK. WE HAVE A GREY WATER STORAGE
TANK THAT WILL BE PROFFESIONALY DRAINED EVERY
OTHER WEEK OR AS NEEDED.



—

Je S Leg

eLb-;r'}f,)C SQL(\S
B FT ?

® o

\ﬂash
Léas

ki o

“Tanhrogl P

ENVTER

Wﬁlé Tt g

ENTER -



S¥ Tradlge

Caorher

ﬁn f/ri\lﬁ

u\\zxvéx

S ?),wv,
&)
on
m&ni&s
wmzf
K
fod
()
,ﬂ@ vr
v "

W Phw

xS



EXHIBIT A

Site Plan

EXISTING RETAIL

Tenbrook Road

. =
S ! PUNDIE, ASSm—
] ! — ———
o |
.
— |
s |
+ Ry Wi |
IS SP ST S ava
H s e - o
H ~l . o 1 - J .
H < I i
¢ D eatans P
; i 5 R iy
H i s 7
: F: /
i RE
i
: :
i ! i i
H H 7
H - H
; 7 [
: . :
|
H
&
R AggHgRCTIA, STE LA

18



8.B

CITY OF ARNOLD, CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
FROM: MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR

SUBJECT: 2014-37 EXTENSION FOR C-4 DEVELOPMENT PLAN, FIVE STAR AUTO BODY
PARCEL-WEST OUTER ROAD, PLANNING COMMISSION RECOMMENDATION

DATE: MARCH 24, 2017
LG

REQUEST
Eric Hummel with Five Star Automotive has requested an extension for his C-4 Development Plan.
SUMMARY OF THE PLANNING COMMISSION

The Planning Commission considered this request at theit March 14, 2017 meeting. There was discussion
surrounding undetermined changes to the building footprint and whether or not those needed formal approval. A
determination could not be made since there was nothing submitted for Staff review. After the discussion, the
Commission voted 8-0 to forward a recommendation of extending the approval until June 1, 2018.

ANALYSIS

The current status of this project is that Mr. Hummel has an approved Site Improvement Plan and Grading Permit.
Grading has progressed but has been halted for some time, storm water systems are not constructed, and sanitary
sewer main is complete. The Building Department has not seen, reviewed or issued a building permit as of yet;
however, Mr. Hummel addresses this item along with an estimated timeline in his request letter. The request letter is
included with this staff report.

With that said, the requirements of the approved Rezoning and C-4 ordinance are identified in Section 2. Of Bill 2604
Ordinance 14.489, this is attached for reference. “The Developer shall have until the date, which is two years
following the effective date of this Ordinance, to file final development plans (the “Final Development Plan) with
the Planning Commission. Substantial construction or development of the Property must be commenced no later
than eighteen months following the effective date of this Ordinance.”

Per Section 405.340 "C-4" Planned Commercial District which allows for an extension, “...submission of final
development plans and completion of construction may be extended by the City Council for cause.”

Staff is presenting this request to the Planning Commission for their review and recommendation to City Council.
The two year expiration date is April 2, 2017. Mr. Hummel is requesting for the approval of an extension with an
expiration date of June 21, 2018.



FIVE STAR

AUJUTO BODY

February 28, 2017

Extension Request for C-4 Land Development

The property identified as Lot 1 of Hummel Properties, A Consolidation Plat Of A Tract Of Land
Being Part Of Lot 27 Of U.S. Survey No. 2991 In Townships 42 And 43 North, Ranges 5 And 6
East, 5t Principal Meridian, City OF Arnold, Jefferson County, Missouri.

City of Arnold,

| am formally requesting an extension for the development of my new Five Star Auto Body
facility. The C-4 approval is set to expire on 4/2/17 and | will not be able to meet the deadline.
While | had hopes of a completed project at this time, it has just not been possible.

I have had a couple setbacks causing delays but have recovered and plan to proceed with a new
General Contractor, Innovative Building Concepts out of Washington, MO. My initial budget
has been substantially exceeded causing additional delays but since concerns have been
resolved and feel confident and comfortable with proceeding.

We are currently waiting for finalized building plans from my Architect. | propose to have
finalized drawings to staff by May 1% for review. With staff approval we would like to break
ground by August to have a completed project by Jan1, 2018. While | am confident we can
achieve this | would like to have the extension approved through spring of 2018, just in case.

| genuinely appreciate your consideration of this extension and the initial approval of my
project and feel you will be more than satisfied with the completed project if request is
approved. Please contact me with any questions or concerns.

Sincerely,

Eric Hummel
636-282-5600
ehummel@fivestarautobody.com

P 636.282.5600 F636.282.5601 1756 Jeffco blvd. Arnold, MO 63010 FIVESTARAUTOBODY.COM



Soek-3"

Bill NO. 2604 Ordinance NO. / &/ /¥4

AN ORDINANCE REZONING A TRACT OF LAND IN THE CITY OF ARNOLD,
MISSOURI, IDENTIFIED AS LOT 1 OF HUMMEL PROPERTIES, A CONSOLIDATION
PLAT OF A TRACT OF LAND BEING PART OF LOT 27 OF U.S. SURVEY NO. 2991 IN
TOWNSHIPS 42 AND 43 NORTH, RANGES 5 AND 6 EAST, 5™ PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN,
CITY OF ARNOLD, JEFFERSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

WHEREAS, an application to rezone a tract of land known as Lot 1 Of Hummel Properties, A
Consolidation Plat Of A Tract Of Land Being Part Of Lot 27 Of U.S. Survey No. 2991 In
Townships 42 And 43 North, Ranges 5 And 6 East, 5 Principal Meridian, City Of Amold,
Jefferson County, Missouri to C-4 Commercial has been submitted to the City of Amold, and

WHEREAS, the proper public hearings have been held, pursuant to City Ordinance and the laws
of the State of Missouri, and

WHEREAS, the Planning Commission has submitted its report and recommendation to the City

Council on the proposed rezoning from R-4 to C-4 Commercial, and

WHEREAS, the Council finds that this rezoning request meets the conditions in that the
extension of the C-4 boundary appear to meet the code requirements for buffering commercial
from residential; there has been a notable change in the area to warrant the zone change; and our
Comprehensive Plan indicates this area as a commercial node and while auto body is a service,
there will be a limited commercial component to the auto body business.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
ARNOLD, MISSOURI, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: The property identified as Lot 1 Of Hummel Properties, A Consolidation Plat Of A
Tract Of Land Being Part Of Lot 27 Of U.S. Survey No. 2991 In Townships 42 And 43 North,
Ranges 5 And 6 East, 5 Principal Meridian, City Of Amold, Jefferson County, Missouri is
rezoned from R-4 to C-4 Planned Commercial and will be developed in accordance with the
provisions of this ordinance, Exhibit A and other applicable laws of the City of Amold.

Section 2. The Developer shall have until the date, which is two years following the effective
date of this Ordinance, to file final development plans (the “Final Development Plan™) with the
Planning Commission. Substantial construction or development of the Property must be
commenced no later than eighteen months following the effective date of this Ordinance.

Section 3. Approval of the Preliminary Development Plan, in accordance with Section 6, C-4
Planned Commercial District of the City’s Zoning Code, is hereby granted, subject to the
conditions, rules, regulations and restrictions as set forth in Exhibit A and the condition outlined

below:



1. Michael Garrett, ISA Certified Arborist, recommendation of minor grading, root
pruning and nutrition plan to the cluster of trees identified as 188, 189, 190, 191, 192,

193 and 195 must be followed.

2. Any trees indicated to be saved that die within two years from completion must be
replaced with caliper for caliper.

3. No bare bulbs, exposed wall packs, etc. are allowed. All lighting must be shielded
and down cast to prevent light trespass.

4. A contribution to the sidewalk fund will be required at the time of any permits being
applied for.

5. We will need proof of all easement vacations prior to the issuance of any permits,

6. Suggest using natives for the buffer strip such as cedars,

Section 4: The property identified as Lot 1 Of Hummel Properties, A Consolidation Plat Of A
Tract Of Land Being Part Of Lot 27 Of U.S. Survey No. 2991 In Townships 42 And 43 North,
Ranges 5 And 6 East, 5" Principal Meridian, City Of Amold, Jefferson County, Missouri is
hereby subject to the rules and regulations as outlined in Exhibit A and shall be the governing
document for the proposed project. Where rules and regulations are not specified in the Exhibit
A, then the codes of the City of Arnold shall govem.

Section 5 This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and approval
by the Mayor and City Council.



READ TWO TIMES, PASSED AND APPROVED THIS g/ —/2(2/ DAY OF APRIL 2015.

Presiémg( ;fﬁcer of the Council
oy ép

Maybr Ron Counts

ATTEST:

W2 éf (Mé/

City Clerk Tammi Casey

1st reading: /0’Z ]
2nd reading: @)

7z
_‘p_z:ney'ﬁﬁﬁrt Sweeney

March 26, 2015

ZNCITYDOCS\ORDINANC \c4 fivestar.doc



8.C

CITY OF ARNOLD, CITY COUNCIL, APRIL 6, 2017 MEETING

TO: THE PLANNING COMMISSION
FROM: MARY P. HOLDEN, COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DIRECTOR
SUBJECT: 2017-02, CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT FOR A SHAVED ICE STAND AT 1857
JEFFCO BLVD
DATE: MARCH 23, 2017
CC:
Request

Mr. and Mrs. Talbert, applicant, have submitted for approval of a conditional use permit to operate
a shaved ice stand at 1857 Jeffco Blvd., on the site of the existing car wash. The shaved ice stand is 7
feet by ten feet and is proposed to be located in a parking stall in front of the space that was slated to
be one of the two dog wash spaces (but never built) along with a table and chairs. The hours of
operation are proposed daily from 12 p.m. to 10 p.m. March 1% through October 31*. They ate
requesting approval for as long as possible. Attached are the application, site plan, pictutes of the
shaved ice stand, aerial of the site and response to the criteria used to review a conditional use permit.

Summary

‘The Planning Commission held a public hearing and considered this request at their March 28,
2017 meeting. No one spoke during the public hearing and there was no discussion duting the regular
meeting. The Commission voted 9-0 to forward a recommendation of approval with the below
findings and conditions:

Findings:

1. The use can be operated in a manner that is not detrimental to the permitted developments
and uses in the district.

2. The use can be developed and operated in a manner that is visually compatible with the
permitted uses in the surrounding area.

Conditions:

—

The approval is granted for March 1 through October 31.

2. The shaved ice stand must be removed from the site on or before November 7 of each

yeat.

The shaved ice stand may not be placed on the site before March 1.

4. The conditional use permit is approved per this plan for a period of three (3) seasons
running through to November 7, 2019.

5. Hours of operation are daily 12 p.m. till 10 p.m.

&



6. The shaved ice stand must be located a minimum of five (5) feet from the existing building.

The area is kept clean of trash and debris that may result from the snow cone stand.

8. All necessary permits are issued in conjunction with opening the snow cone stand.
Specifically Jefferson County Health and Rock Community Fire Protection District.

by

Analysis

This the same location as last year and operated without issues. The site looks crowded on paper
since this is a copy of the commercial site plan approval from 2004 showing the required parking for
the car wash. In reality, the entire parking is rarely, if ever, at capacity. And with the nature of the
shaved ice stand, parking for customers appeats to be accommodated on site.

Please verify that the applicant is able to use the existing trashcans for the car wash and has access
to the restroom on site.

The applicant has indicated they would like approval for the longest possible period. Based on their
operation last year and lack of issues, Staff recommends approval of the conditional use for three (3)
years (including this year and running through 2019), expiring on November 7, 2019.

A final comment is the shaved ice stand may not be located closer than 5 feet to the existing
building per our Building codes.

When reviewing a conditional use permit, the following must be taken into consideration:
The use is deemed consistent with good planning practice.

‘The use can be operated in a manner that is not detrimental to the permitted developments
and uses in the district.

The use can be developed and operated in a manner that is visually compatible with the
permitted uses in the surrounding area.

The use is deemed essential or desirable to preserve and promote the public health, safety,
and general welfare of the City of Arnold.




W

Community Development Departugen
City of Arnold
2101 Jeffco Blvd.
Arnold, MO 63010

636-2822378
636-282-6677 Fax
CONDITIONAL USE PERMIT
APPLICATION
7-07 [

File Numbt':r__;??( $400.00 Fee Paid 5 H ( 7
APPLICA_NT/C{)NTRACT PURCHASER OWNER:

Tﬂuw \ U\\\mti ”{ = ngcﬂc U N D@FS*lan 510
Name \ \"L(kﬂ(/h% Name [&50

" . : ¥, i

710 La Wacde D 885051 1957 Seffro B Brnold),

Address, City, State, Zip Address, City, State, Zip
L2-Y94- 0470 214-764-2643
Telephone Number Teiephone Number
0
NJA N
Facsimile Number Facsimile Number
e - . S {

1257 et Bled
Property Address (or nearest intersection) Zoning of property
Proposed Use: %"\ AN Ll ’ LOE \(j’.}((} A (}’
Adjacent Zoning/Uses
North South East West
Date of application Meetlng date targeting
=S e, e obnt d /e/M foendl_

Signature of Owner
30

Signature of Applicant




R&M Tropical Sno will operate from March 1*
through October 31% each year. The hours of
operation will be from 12pm to 10pm daily.

| would like to apply for the longest possible permit
at this time, the maximum allowed.

1. Consistent with good planning practice;

2. Can be operated in a manner that is not detrimental to the permitted developments
and uses in the district;

3. Can be developed and operated in @ manner that is visually compatible with the
permitted uses in the surrounding area;

4. Deemed essential or desirable to preserve and promote the public health, safety. and
general welfare of the City of Arnold.

1. R&M Tropical Sno has been consistent with the
City of Arnold’s planning practice and has
maintained the precedent that has been
previously set by other businesses in the area.

2.R&M Tropical Sno can and will be operated in a
way that causes no conflict to other permitted
developments and uses in the district. The
business will be placed in such a way that no



issues will arise in other businesses or
permitted locations within the district out of
respect for the city of Arnold and the businesses
themselves. We have no interest in detracting
from others in the surrounding area. We will
also draw more business to the area as shaved
ice is very popular.

3.R&M Tropical Sno will operate in a way that is
visually compatible with the surrounding area
through the use of our physical building and
how we treat the surrounding area. Our
building is visually a premium unit that will help
make the surrounding area look friendly, pretty
and fun, which also aligns with the current
visual aspects of the neighborhood. Also as a
business, all trash and spills will immediately be
cleaned up to preserve the visual aspects of the
district.

4.R&M Tropical Sno is both essential and
desirable for promoting the public health,
safety, and general welfare of the city of Arnold



because shaved ice stands help promote
community. We can provide a well lit and safe
area for the community to gather and enjoy a
hice summer treat. We can also promote
exercising as we are within walking distance of
many neighborhoods. We have two other
locations and we have learned from experience
that they are great places to have kids meet
their friends in a safe environment, and hang
out for a while. We enjoy watching our kids
grow up from year to year, and eventually begin
to work at Tropical Sno. We bring employment
to the area, as well as revenue for the city. We
have never had any issues at any of our
locations it has always been a positive
experience. It’s also a great hang out for adults.



WeZ@qermission to use the trash bin and the restroom at the car wash at 1857 Jeffco Blvd ¢ Qlfk!‘a/}j { D‘JL :

Signature



TS Ay g iy

1950 2YSEM 'O PRWY 10 AID

JuswidojBreq AIUNUALOD PIOUY 0 KD
ANV @ DIALAVN 010Z @ Uaieodion yosoiow /102 @

sywi Ao piousy
usf g0 200 Loo O

T e

Auadoud - sjsoied Ajunon uosiaysy
W g0 SL00 S4000 O

£10Z ‘€T Yoten

1amalA depy eseg S|9 aulluo ON PIoUWIY Jo AlD




4
(Y,
£r
.
z.n.“\‘\.,:x“w,
$rresr,
¢ rrrepis
2.2__2_::“-3. 3+

FLLLLLE LR

Ll s

¥

[
\:..::33..::
(SOl et irtery
Ty

&r
.‘...\\_:.\:.\:\\:\
Far s
FLLES, YV R CEEELIEEI PP EIE AR ELEr 11/ PATeR e
FRFLELPRESEPEPEERPEL FRriiifEheterres s R
PHECdpariecrpeiitets i
4 i
V‘

P ArIrr it ? A
LLLEEL LR \_:.\\\“ﬁ.:.\._.::\C.::Z:.;_ f
FLLPERErTEL, i firs \:.._1:\2.:::_.:..“ *Hh\:.:.:.:_:
SLfrErrel it (LLALAELTETERIEECLELIRRER Lffrcpsi LT

{.F x\\_?.\.:.\::::::..:..w.ﬁ B A
.\_\:{\:::::_‘.?2...321:::..:2.(.. :.ﬁwm

(T
prfrees
pprEbreles
.:w:x...:.x:..

N

A

| Sy e aee Wl WIS WAt
. . W W R

Yoy

cerpar el
T T

:.\\\_:.\\..\:..::T_:I_::

Frpsfdrfes

.\:_:_::.“.:_..
s rrrpcertteiidl

\:.:_\\5\__::_
jrirddedsr it
PAEEE

pareftEfre
AH\\\,\\.
it
PR
..:\\:.::
\...:.:..:.:
»«:t:\:
.w_...:.._:.:
S e
s:::w

grertis
ad

Spriid

pretit

el

2edrd
r

_.axx\‘:._w

G

__:.1\\-.

fi
'

saitd!
iy
i

s i dd
W

itf

2 fd
y |
»»\




o . . S A R, TR

o s, . . Y O O ma le
@ i v i T, 4R, T, R, W, S

T

e ]
e s, v i

e, o sy e S R

T R Tt S, R

. T, T S, .’

o e, Y T, S e, M
A A, N W,

SR

., . s, S, ke, T ', L R

=

T s e, T TR
R B = )

)
T, T T e, e, Balh,

s T e, i, TR T, T T TR,
e, T, S, S, Y, 0. T R NG, Ay T

T T e R P VT

N AN
LAV

LA

~

\\\\\\\\\\\
ol st b LA S AL AL AL
LA 0 0 i o S o AP
\w\\....~\-.~..

A

‘-&a,\\v-x

v,

FMEGERTSETAT Pt g
e S

L
or
o
o

? i
T A s R
PS4 '
\\\\‘\\\\. o8
PN N o A i
Fa ¥
\..\x\\.\_. ‘
‘._.s\-\._\\\\‘)x
\\‘.x\\\ku...‘,\\
L Lo
\\\\\\w\s\ _

s
;
.
ﬁ\w\\\a.\\x.,
s
Ve
7
.
‘

Vo o8 ¥ £

A

LA A s

PR

sx;;.x\\\x\\.

B ol A A

i

S
5

s

~
N
G Ml G S

Ay

e T L N T e W
S SN
2

s P Y

S
oy

1\\\\‘-,\\\-»\\

SRS

L N

.

1

...\\\\ \\\\«\\\w.m‘\\ax.

L lLer T e

L EL P L A
‘.\....,\\\\.ﬁ....,,.
_....xxx\,\\nuxn.‘ R
SN RN AT W A A RN
PR AN N ) "
,\.~\,\.\\\\\.\.‘.x\.\u‘
YAELF R \\-\xx_....

T

A

N

)
\\\\..\....\xx\~<~

_\,\.\~\\.\‘

F2rdd

¥ LA A A R
N G S R N A R R A A,
N N A N N N
‘\\,..,._.\“..\\.\«\\‘\‘...\\.n
,.\\a_.\x‘..\~\.‘.x..\\.\.\.‘....~‘

u\x\\\x\xaxx‘

_\~x\~\1~\\\\q-\-a

\\\\\\\\\\.

1.\\\\‘

.x\\.‘\
X

..\\..‘x\\\\

.\\..\».:\\\._...:\.«\..:

i

ies sk

_.\._.\....\a

\\\\\‘~\\‘\

i e sk

~ i

'

.\‘\\\x\\

\\\..\\\\‘\\~\‘-

PR

Py

CACH A A s

\\‘x\s‘~x\\ms\\\\-\

‘-

S AP EEL
Lfisded
i

\\.‘..‘

\-\\\1\-.5-«.\k.]

,..\\\\\\ux\\xfﬂ‘\‘.:\.q.
% P )
. n._\4|\..1 ’ .
LA A

.\\\.,...~\
‘\\\..\\..‘\

\\\\~»

«\\\\
PN

\wx\.\xn\
‘.:.s\...:.\\\\

;.s\‘.\ak.\s-
\\\._\\~\\\_\\\\_.

ARV IERX,
R R
S R X

AP TR Y X IRy

\\\\sxx\.\

Lar
e ..\..\\\..\..~\n‘.x\\.‘....
5 4 . S
..._.\\__‘.«\\...xx‘...\‘w‘.u....«
rhdd g
or £ el bt N

A

PR R

b rd A

N N Y e d LA R
£ afafnl KL

AN aln N e 8

N : b i
I ) eSS
7 / % pr o oA AE #
A A nr PP
s B R 3

S N T

N T T B S N T

T T e S

AN N NN S a A

BamA RN A AN RAR N NSNS

- s

e

.
e
-
r
r
r
’

LT S

LN

LI T T

(NN

T




ik ERRURLY |




ot

Y b




11 Byt inbuy g VNG oLy Bapuoce;

B4 AUNS HINOS ¥ AVMHDUA 010 46T

077 'BupssuiBugz A predsyg

WG 0 aADICH
LON 2 KDIA 40 ERRIEDCS Tt

e e NYTd 31IS AMYIWITTNd
R HSVYM HYD 34VNDS ANOMOIH

NoUdwagEa

3'd 'THVAIHS NIASY ‘LoviNoOD
YOEES OW 'SIMYHO ‘L5
21 3LiNS

X0 40 LIGHNAHING BIV ONY 57D 43 OILVH LNINTD Hilwm 1S3000¥
48 HIINSMS WSSIENCD ¥ SAYH TIWHS Hiom L5 404 Lr3uonoy

“35YG |

3dAL 10PN QAIYANOT .3 HO Z-ci IdAL LOGON 83 3. 3eal ALNAOD
SIN0T IS QUIVAWDD ¢ 39 TIVHS L0EHIAYS LN3NZD OU TWHSY L

“OTLON SY 1430%3 LTvHdSY 38 TIYHS 1S MO SBEnD

SHOUYIIOISS ONY SOSYONYLS GIOHYY JO ALD Hil 3ONYOu03aY
38 TIVHS A¥MEYd FUVN0S ABOMIIH NO g0 FINVHLNG

3
=0 %04 GIDKLSIO COHDS 4
3
z

ONNOYD Y3ONN NOLLNALIQ
408 zas'oL = Q3JVISNYIINMYT
08 LeH'sE = Y3V a3Avd HOWNALIG
1408 lesy = Y3V oNiguNg umu_xzﬁ%uw i
1408 05805 = WINY 1304Yd o, . ; . wzmwm.nzwﬁ ;
S P okt /
SYIYY A1 o, . ANONas —
s 4336
/
L=7 LIIHS 'NWId 3GYOSONYT 3HL s i /
HIM 30NVQMO30¥ M 030335 ¥O (30005 38 TwHS SYINW QIGHNISD B o, 5 %ﬂuﬁv .H
. . =
SHOUNOLOIS STALIVANYA NV SLNGNIUINGIH CIONYY 40 AL P, — P4 3 7
FINYCUOIOV 9 CINIINVN ONY QITIVISH: 38 TIVHS J0M NOD NOUPLYS g pz.,w.z&qa &, . 2 .Nr
BUS BUYA Z 3 N0 INOTNE A 5 5 g0y
HSHA YD 3HL 3USM QITIVASM 38 TWHS MAINIATED AONDOYE ¥ b1 £—0 g3NoZ i P H s T
. 5
LOILSIO 3HI KL 3 " i
OL¥HIAH000 38 Tivks (SHITM WAIWA JL 50 MOWFTIVISA oy £ 1304vd 700, J F ¥
MWK 3L ) OV SNOUYDLIOTaS GNW STEVONYAS | & Loy = 5 . /& G
A74dNS WAUVA OMENd 0L QILINHISNOD 38 Tivms SIAUIS WA T = ¥ g i i O
& i
SROLWIEIISS CHY SONYONYLS  QIONHY 40 ALD INIWHS HIR PR E 2 <
FINYOROJI¥ 1 38 TIVHS NOUOMMISHOD NANIS AMVUNYS ONY WYDLS ‘21 : & 5 . J S i
H0L008d G3LAGCN) (SE1-0-HLSY el g E F2 ] 7
AR SNSYIN S ALSN30 A40 WNIXYN 40 X06 0L 0T ovemoy N Sl : n /
ONY SLIN 35007 .8 NI 030¥1d 38 THHS STVl Tl Woe 11 ) o 04 P v /
{1 g Y 05 16=47 ANBMaAYd g
(1E) TrOUME | QL THLHOZIOH & 330X 1THHS I ¥0 1110 3ubs ON ! AW e S __ ko \w
“OHUHOM TNHILM FAYH TIVHS Sive £ Ny \ . Igvas oy !
HEYM T LHON QILNNON T10d ¥ AYH TVHS CNYISI DN toes s Y ey m.ﬁd( ofidvon t ; i3}
g z = \4j P el { ;
* : ; ]
it it

-

$=7 d3INOZ §1 AUIS ik

HOIMIHL SNOUIVHI TYHIDIC ONW L334 NI MMOHS 24V SNOISHIMQ Tiy
SALYII055Y Ony

HLNOS ¥8 AMH 10 0t 8¢
- ONIHIINIONS TIAID GuvaaHS R £=2 dInNoz
& HIINIONT IOVHIAY AVA/SHYO 011 = WioL R W T £ 1324vd
W U FOVHIAY AYWSHYD 03 = SAvE JULYWOLNY
s Lt e ; i 055E-6¢8 IOVHIAY AYOSHYD 04 = SAVE TV T7Y S 3034 175
H NOl g =Se S o NINMYL Y ¥ W 5
@D ] g LT NOLLVY3NZD DI33vaL e AT [/ igasg .
Hivon # VUL ¥YLS ONINYOW £506 % al 3
z HATUA NI 2 INvd
A NOILYDOT ] AN .

v g f
INOD / H
dan g E 5 (@mnnsgy)

3 5 0000V =AITI naL
3 | GNvis) l\
4 ISIYY-

INITENE A8 03M0483d SV A3AENS JMHSTHICI0L ONY ANYONNDE ECTS Ny
3tow AL
I 4\& NZM?“M“"N\M b—ﬁ. ‘ R & . / ONINIYHIY unM‘
’ sowend B # i T EBy iR NOR dOLS 2=
OLOES RINOCSSIN "ALNNOD NOSHIA43r 'ATONYY JO ALID . . s %

€ 39vd L0} ¥00g 1yid
ST30MVd LOTLNO FYYNDS AHOMOIH 40 § 71304 vd

HSYM ¥VD 390148 AMOMOIH

ANIFEAY LTYHISY (830A MOY)

(AA78 004431 L9-19 AVMHOIF TLv.s




D

March 15, 2017

The Finance Department will be shredding 7 boxes of 2011 Accounts Payable files in April 2017.



Jeanette Yount

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Please add to shredding list

Jennifer Roth

Friday, March 24, 2017 8:34 AM
Jeanette Yount

Shredding

Timesheets January-December 2013

-Thanks

Jennifer



afxlie

March 3, 2016

The following records are set up for destruction April |, 2016
Payroll Registers 2009 Jan-Dec.

Payroll Requests 2011 Jan-Dec

Attendance Records 2012 Jan-Dec

Leave Requests 2012 Jan - Dec.

Joan Boyles, Payroll




Jeanette Yount

e e e e e e e e —

From: Ann Holtmann

Sent: Friday, February 24, 2017 1:49 PM
To: Jeanette Yount

Subject: Shredding

Jeannette

I am requesting the following files be shredded:

‘Lockbox Reports FY13 - 9/1/12-8/31/13

Daily Cash Receipts FY13 -9/1/12-8/31/13

Recreation Center Daily Receipts — FY13-9/1/12-8/31/13
All deposit slip books prior to 2011

Bank Statements/Reconciliations FY12 —9/1/11-8/31/12

Bank Statements/Reconciliations FY13 - 9/1/12-8/31/13

All these files are located in the storage room in the basement of City Hall, in the to be shredded pile.
Thanks

Ann Holtmann



Jeanette Yount

From: Ann Holtmann

Sent: Wednesday, March 29, 2017 10:25 AM
To: Jeanette Yount

Cc Deborah Lewis

Subject: Shredding

Jeanette,

| request that the following files be approved by council for shredding

Daily Receipts/Deposit Activity for the following:
FY2003
FY2004
FY2005
FY2008
FY2009
FY2010
Fy2011

Bank Statements and Reconciliations
FY2004
FY2005
FY2006
FY2007
FY2008
FY2009
FY2010
FY2011
FY2012

General Fund and Payroll Checks on CD - 10/1997-09/2003

Recreation Center/Ferd B Lang Pool Daily Deposits, Bank Statements,
and Reconciliations for the following years
FY2006
FY2007
FY2008
FY2009
FY2010

Golf Daily Receipts/Deposits
FY2007
FY2008
FY2009
FY2010

Thanks



Memorandum from the Municipal Court

March 29, 2017

The Municipal Court is destroying 24 boxes of court files from the year 2013.
They have met their 3 year retention requirement.

The Municipal Court is also destroying Red Light Camera Tickets from 2008
through 2014. They were kept longer than required due to possible litigation but
are no longer necessary.

Attached is the breakdown of boxes to be shredded.



SHRED LIST FOR 2017

In Town Business Licenses (retention 10 years)
2006 to 2007

Miscellaneous In Town Business Licenses
1997 to 2006

Out of Town Business Licenses (retention 3 years)
2003 to 2013

Sunshine Law Requests (retention 3 years)
2006 to 2013

Refund of Utility Taxes (retention 3 years)
2006 to 2013

0ld Miscellaneous Bids
1988 to 1998

Bids (retention S years)
2009 to 2011

2009 Aquatic Feasibility
2009 Audio Bid

Miscellaneous RFQ’s and RFP’s (retention 10 years)
1995 to 2006

Title Company Requests (retention 5 years)
2010
2011

Vending Machine Licenses (retention 2 years)
2007 to 2013

Solicitor/Peddler Licenses (retention 2 years)
1997 to 2013

Trash Compliance Requests (retention 3 years)
2013

Miscellaneous Collection Letters
2008 to 2012

Receipts for Returned Checks (completion of audit)
2007 to 2015




% IN THE _ 23"

i

F ain I winat N B S

JUDICIAL CIRCUIT COURT, __Jefferson County, MISSOURI

Division:
[J Circunit/No.

[Et Municipal

[J Associate/No.
Cityof oLt

[C]Probate/No.

Contact Person: LQ WAALE Z,#Q ‘1= E‘/\./ Phone Numbey 2;0_3(& 2& 82 Qé AN

Signature of Contact Per?m

(Date File Stamp)

period.

satisfied.

Therefore, it is ordered that (BZ UM K \CH 1 .‘5&‘1\/

described below.

i H/ - & '\-_/
Court Operating Rule 8§ authorizes the chief justice, presiding judge, or chair of the Fine Collections Center with the
[] The records listed below were offered to State Archives and local historical organizations and were

The records listed below are not required to be offered to State Archives and local historical organizations.

(Appointing Authority) destroy the records

approval of the court en banc or committee, to issue orders of destruction for those records that have met the required retention

[ refused or [_] no response was received after 45 days. All requirements under Court Operating Rule 8 have been

Order of Destruction

ALl ?@9@5 AWE, &e Z

[RET E?EW??QU

Book or Case Number Series Book Title or Case Type Dates of Cases/Books
BOX1 A-M January 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed January 2013
BOX 2 N-Z January 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed Jan-Feb. 2013
A-G February
BOX 3 H-Z February 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed February 2013
BOX 4 A-O March 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed March 2013
| BOX 5 P-Z March 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed April 2013
A-Z April 2013

Zoolsz

Date

Open Records to be destroyed Ey the following method: 5/7%5234@%/ s

Chief Justice, Presiding Judge, or Chair of the FCC Signature

OSCA (4-10) GNIS

1 of 1

COR 8




S} 4 v
e M JUDICIAL CIRCUIT COURT, M@u C@wfm , MISSOQURI
;A = [
Division: \ A7
[J Circuit/No. [0 Associate/No. [] Probate/No. @ Q \)

¥ Municipal cityof e s Moidest @%SW
' n/ Phone Number((36 ) o2 82-6495 3// 7// 7

o’ : 7y g L
- (/ A it (Date File Stamp)

—
Court Cperating Rule 8 authorizes the chief justice, presiding judge, or chair of the Fine Collections Center with the

Contact Person:

Signature of Contact Persony:

approval of the court en banc or committee, to issue orders of destruction for those records that have met the required retention
period. ,
(] The records listed below were offered to State Archives and local historical organizations and were

[ refused or [] no response was received after 45 days. All requirements under Court Operating Rule 8 have been

satisfied.
The records listed below are not required to be offered to State Archives and local historical organizations,

Therefore, it is ordered that (Appointing Authority) destroy the records

described below.

Order of Destruction

Book or Case Number Series Book Title or Case Type Dates of Cases/Books
BOX #6 H-Z APRIL 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed April 2013
BOX #7 A-R MAY 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed May 2013
BOX #8 S-Z MAY 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed May &June 2013
A-MC JUNE 2013
BOX #9 A-Z 2013 2013 Dismissed 2013
BOX #10 Mc-Z JUNE 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed June & July 2013
A-FJULY
ALL RECORDS HAVE MET
RETENTION PERIOD

Open Records to be destroyed by the following method: S/ymﬁﬂ/ (A

Date Chief Justice, Presiding Judge, or Chair of the FCC Signature

OSCA (4-10) GN15 1of 1 COR 8




, MISSOURT

J—
INTHE 27" JUDICIAL CIR CUIT COURT, ~ etz @nw?/

Division:

[J Circuit/No.

;ZCMunicipal

[0 Associate/No.
City of /,4@;/:9 L

(] Probate/No.

oY

Signature of Contact Person;

Contact Person: ,49)4@5 /é/h/?é‘/t/ Phone N

eif @é )Z282-645% ?-D’N
Lt

i
ol

i

(Date File Stamp)

period.

satisfied.

Therefore, it is ordered that

L described below,

» 3 \"‘"/ . : . \‘:'/ »
Court Operating Rule 8 authorizes the chief Justice, presiding judge, or chair of the Fine Collections Center with the
approval of the court en banc or committee, to issue orders of destruction for those records that have met the required retention

(] The records listed below were offered to State Archives and local historical organizations and were

[ refused or [ no response was received after 45 days. All requirements under Court Operating Rule 8 have been

M The records listed below are not required to be offered to State Archives and local historical organizations.

(Appointing Authority) destroy the records

Order of Destruction

Book or Case Number Series

BOX # 13 P-Z AUGUST 2013
A-Z SEPT. 2013
BOX #14 K-Z SEPT. 2013
A-F OCT. 2013
BOX #15 G-Z OCT. 2013
A NOV. 2013

ALL RECORDS HAVE MET
RETENTION PERIOD

2013 Minor traffic & dismissed

2013 Minor traffic & dismissed

2013 Minor traffic & dismissed

Book Title or Case Type Dates of Cases/Books
BOX #11 G-Z JULY 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed July 2013
BOX #12 A-O AUGUST 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed August 2013

August-Sept. 2013

Sept.-Oct. 2013

Oct.-Nov, 2013

_____SHREDDING

Open Records to be destroyed by the following method:

Date

Chief Justice, Presiding Judge, or Chair of the FCC Signature

OSCA (4-10) GNIS

1of 1

COR 8




‘3 INTHEQQE JUDICIAL CIRCUIT COURT;\ fe‘%eszw &Dm/?y
Dlsion

|COF “"N
[J Circuit/No. [ Associate/No, [ Probate/No. @
ﬁ Municipal City of ﬁ-@‘t/ och

ol g "L{/(/fz
Contact Person; W" /(471:?/:71/ Phgne Number(ré )252. 4653 ﬂ{q UJZ? g/

» MISSOURI

-

Signature of Contact Persony” 2 ./,c/x,c,(,.
"\_/

(Date File Stamp)

or chair of the Fine Collections Center with the
approval of the court en banc or committee, to issue orders of destruction for those records

period.

o —
Court Operating Rule 8 authorizes the chief Justice, presiding judge,

that have met the required retention

(] The records listed below were offered to State Archives and local historical organizations and were

[ refused or (] no response was received after 45 days. All requirements under Court

Operating Rule 8 have been
satisfied.
The records listed below are not required to be offered to State Archives and local historical organizations
Therefore, it is ordered that (Appointing Authority) destroy the records
described below,
Order of Destruction
Book or Case Number Series Book Title or Case Type Dates of Cases/Books j

BOX #16 B-Z NOV.2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed November 2013

BOX #17 A-Z DEC. 2013 2013 Minor traffic & dismissed December 2013
ALL RECORDS HAVE MET
RETENTION PERIOD

Open Records to be destroyed by the following method:
_____SHREDDING

Date

Chief Justice, Presiding Judge, or Chair of the FCC S Signature
1ofl

OSCA (4-10) GNI5 COR 8



g g, . gt
& @ IN THE ,Ziw JUDICIAL CIRCUIT COURT, ~J €--6e 5 Cowff?/ J—

Division:

[J Circuit/No, [ Associate/No. ] Probate/No. @P‘\f " /
[%Municipal City of /?,@A/ 0 Lo @ b{_ci’?u
y ]
Wbl

(Date File Stamp)

Court Operating Rule 8 Mzes the chief justice, presiding judge, or chair of the Fine Collections Center with the
approval of the court en banc or committee, to issue orders of destruction for those records that have met the required retention

period,

(] The records listed below were offered to State Archives and local historical organizations and were

[ refused or [Jno response was received after 45 days. All requirements under Court Operating Rule 8 have been
satisfied.

*

The records listed below are not required to be offered to State Archives and local historical organizations.

Therefore, it is ordered that _ BRYAN RICHISON (Appointing Authority)
destroy the records described below. '
Order of Destruction

Book or Case Number Series Book Title or Case Type Dates of Cases/Bogks
BOX #18 YEAR 2008 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2008
BOX #19 YEAR 2010 & 2011 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2010 & 2011 -
BOX #20 YEAR 2012 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2012
BOX #21 YEAR 2012 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2012
BOX #22 YEAR 2013 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2013
BOX #23 YEAR 2013 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2013
BOX #24 TRAFFIC LIGHT CAMERA 2013 & 2014
ALL RECORDS HAVE MET
RETENTION PERIOD

Open Records to be destroyed by the following method:
SHREDDING

Date Chief Justice, Presiding Judge, or Chair of the FCC Signature

OSCA (4-10) GNIS ' Lofl COR 8





